Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 3 January 2025 2:24 PM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/030310 - Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G *** LKK
REF: CD/LPC24120243/Tma3

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf; LKK SURVEY PHOTO.pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf

Categories: HMK

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is:

. TP estimated cost of repair
J Preliminary advice
J Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Please note that our officer in charge is Daphne.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2024 7:24 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Daphne Lee (LKK
Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/030310 - Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G *** LKK REF:
CD/LPC24120243/Tma3

Lonpac External - Confidential

Lonpac External - Confidential



Dear Mei Kwan,

Please refer to attached OI GIA.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all “New " lonpac

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 December 2024 4:18 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/030310 - Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G *** LKK REF:
CD/LPC24120243/Tma3

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action.

Wosderjul, Chontotmas Pappy New Year 2085 |

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 3:41 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/030310 - Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that the vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Cheers to a Woaderjul Christmas and a Fappy Hew Year 2085

Best Regards,
Hueh Yin | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 3:25 PM

To: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com>; Richmond Ho
<richmond.ho@wearnes.com>

Subject: FW: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/030310 - Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G
Importance: High

Lonpac External - Confidential

Lonpac External - Confidential



Dear Hueh Yin,

FYNA.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 3:19 pm

To: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/030310 - Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G
Importance: High

Lonpac External - Confidential

Hi Huey Ni

Noted. Kindly let us know who is coming so that we could arrange, thanks

Richmond Ho
Senior Service Consultant
Body & Paint — Insurance Claim

Weames Automotive Pte Ltd

V 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4390 M (65) 9176 8543
WEARNES wwav weamesauto.com  richmond. ho@@wearnes.com

Thiz email, including any sifachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If your have recsived it in armor, pleass natify us immedialely by reply email and then delete this message from your sysiem.
FPleass do not copy it or use i for any purposs, or disclose iis contents or any atfachment fo any other person. Thank you.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



From: ENG HUEY NI <hneng@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 2:57 PM

To: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: ORef: 24/24/24/VC05/030310 - Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G

Lonpac External - Confidential

Lonpac External - Confidential

WITHOUT PREJUDICE SAVE AS TO COST
Hi Richmond,

Our insured reported his vehicle lightly touched your client’s vehicle at rear portion. No visible damage to your
client’s vehicle.

Please let us survey your client’s vehicle on a without prejudice basis to check if there were any damages on it’s
rear portion.

Thank you.

Regards
Huey Ni

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud
or corrupt practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud
or corrupt practices.

From: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 8:43 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G

Lonpac External - General

Morning Gerald

Any update? Can we proceed with direct settlement



Richmond Ho
Senior Service Consultant
Body & Paint — Insurance Claim

Weames Automotive Pte Ltd

V 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4390 M (65) 9176 8543
WEARNES wwav weamesauto.com  richmond. ho@@wearnes.com

Thiz email, including any sifachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If your have recsived it in armor, pleass natify us immedialely by reply email and then delete this message from your sysiem.
FPleass do not copy it or use i for any purposs, or disclose iis contents or any atfachment fo any other person. Thank you.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud
or corrupt practices.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 12, 2024 10:07 AM

To: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G
Importance: High

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Richmond,

Our insured has not lodged the accident report and we are unable to revert on Direct
Settlement.

Please let us know if you want us to arrange for the survey.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud
or corrupt practices.



We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud
or corrupt practices.

From: Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>
Sent: Thursday, 12 December 2024 10:02 am

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@I|onpac.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement For SIN6199D & GBG38G
Importance: High

Hi

Kindly see attached and check if possible for direct settlement

Richmond Ho
Senior Service Consultant
Body & Paint — Insurance Claim

Weames Automotive Pte Ltd

_V_ 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4390 M (65) 9176 8543
WEARNES wwav weamesauto.com  richmond. ho@@wearnes.com

Thiz email, including any sifachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If your have recsived it in armor, pleass natify us immedialely by reply email and then delete this message from your sysiem.
FPleass do not copy it or use i for any purposs, or disclose iis contents or any atfachment fo any other person. Thank you.



