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Hueh Yin (LKK Auto)

From: Pauline Tham (CTPIS) <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 2:32 PM
To: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz; SUR; assignments
Cc: Zoey Kian Zhi Yeu; Richmond Ho; Chan Yau Chiang
Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT: SMU3038H & SNJ9256B, DOA: 14/12/2024

[Internal] 

 
  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Sir, 
  
Thanks for your reply. 
  
Hi LKK 
  
Please conduct PRS.  
  
  
Thanks. 
  
Pauline Tham 
Claims Department 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6541   |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
  
  
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmiƩed with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidenƟal informaƟon. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or disseminaƟon of this message, either in whole or parƟal, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please noƟfy the 
sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereaŌer. 
  
From: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 14:13 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Zoey Kian Zhi Yeu <zoey.kian@wearnes.com>; Richmond Ho <richmond.ho@wearnes.com>; Chan Yau Chiang <yauchiang.chan@wearnes.com> 
Subject: RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT: SMU3038H & SNJ9256B, DOA: 14/12/2024 
Importance: High 
  

  

Hi Motor Claims, 
  

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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We choose LKK Rasul to conduct survey. 
  
Please advise liability status. 
  
Thank you 
  
Paulo 
Service Consultant 
Bodyshop & Paint  
  

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd 
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103 
M (65) 98270463  
www.wearnesauto.com      juan.paulo@wearnes.com 
  

  
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.  
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.  
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you. 
  
From: Zoey Kian Zhi Yeu <zoey.kian@wearnes.com>  
Sent: Monday, December 16, 2024 9:18 PM 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Juan Paulo Bongon Baldoz <juan.paulo@wearnes.com> 
Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT: SMU3038H & SNJ9256B, DOA: 14/12/2024 
  
Hi Motor Claims, 
  
For claim registration. 
  
Besides, kindly check if your insured lodge their accident report & advise liability. 
  
Revert to us as soon as possible. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Zoey Kian 
Service Consultant 
Bodyshop & Paint  
  

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd 
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103 
M (65) 91294556 
www.wearnesauto.com       zoey.kian@wearnes.com 

  


