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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Linus Neo <linusneoks@gmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, 14 December 2024 9:09 AM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNN 3141S (CHINA TAIPING) AND SNN 9691G 

AT/ALONG BUKIT TIMAH ROAD ON 28/11/2024

Hi Daphne  
 
Thank you for the Email. The only evidence are the photos taken onsite as my memory card from dash 
cam was corrupted and unable to re format. Please let me know if need any assistance from my side. 
 
Regards 
Linus 
 
On Fri, 13 Dec 2024, 14:24 Daphne Lee (LKK Auto), <daphnelee@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Our Ref: CD/CTI24120167/Ama3 

  

Dear NEO KOK SERN, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNN 3141S (CHINA TAIPING) AND SNN 9691G AT/ALONG BUKIT TIMAH 
ROAD ON 28/11/2024 

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed 
by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim 
against your policy. 

We have received a claim from SNN 9691G against your motor insurance policy. 

  

Both parties involved have given conflict of version. Please provide us evidence for our review as 
following:- 

1) Video footage 

  

  

  

*Please note that Sect II Excess $1362.50 (9% gst) applies under your policy. 
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Thank you 

  

  

Cheers to a Wonderful Christmas and a Happy New Year 2025 ! 

  

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 

  


