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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Lim Yan Shi Jenn <jenn.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, April 8, 2025 3:40 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Coco Lu Ting; Loi Ai Ting
Subject: III / TP Claim / DPS / Our ref: SDG552P Your ref: SHD2125U DOA: 03.12.2024
Attachments: 08042025153534-0001.pdf

Dear Sir, 
 
AƩached our repair invoice, Car Rental Invoice, and leƩer of authorizaƟon for your perusal. 
 
Our client’s claim is as stated below: 
 

COR $   2,965.89   
LOR $   1,308.00 $130.80 x 10D 

  $  4,273.89   
 
Kindly offer for seƩlement 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Jenn Lim (Ms) 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
TEL: 6568 4693  F: +65 6565 1240  •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the 
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the 
intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any 
attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by 
return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, 
and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  
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