Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Reliable Carz <reliablecarzpl@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 27 December 2024 12:23 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: SNQ 7754G - Finalize

Hi,

Accept the recommendation.

Thanks and regards,
Jason

On 27 Dec 2024, at 10:32 AM, Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam,

Any status as below?

2025

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 18 December 2024 10:51 PM

To: reliablecarzpl@gmail.com

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SNQ 7754G - Finalize

Hi Sir,
Kindly refer our finalize $3750.00 (L/S, before GST). 4 days (Subject to insurance approval)

Please confirm.



Thanks and regards,
Steve Chen
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




