
AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTE LTD 
38 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E1 
#05-18 SINGAPORE 757700 

TEL：64688834 / FAX: 64622278 

E-MAIL: info@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd 

Attn: Motor Claims Dept 

 
 

LETTER OF DEMAND 
 

Dear Sir/ Madam,  

  

Accident involving vehicles: SJN9944A & SHC1677E 

Date & location: 03/12/24, Downtown East drop-off point exit 

 

We understand that you are the insurer of vehicle SHC1677E. 

  

I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SJN9944A has completed repairs to my/our 

satisfaction by M/s Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd. I/We therefore propose to claim 

from you as follows: 

 

1. Cost of Repair      S$ 2,834.00 (w/GST 9%) 

 

2. Loss of Rental (S$100.00 x total 8 days)              S$ 800.00 
 

➢ 5 approved days + 1 weekend + 1 non-working day  
 

o The survey was conducted in the late afternoon at 2.45pm on Tuesday, 

10/12/24.  
 

o The number of repair days crossed over the weekend.  
 

o The non-working Sunday incurred charges as per the rental bill.  

 

➢ 1 more day  
 

o The rental car was collected in the early morning on Tuesday, 10/12/24.  
 

o The day of collection incurred charges as the first hiring day as per the 

rental bill. 

 

     TOTAL  S$ 3,634.00 

 

Please let us have your reply as soon as possible. 

 

Thank you. 
 

 

 
      03/03/25 

mailto:info@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg






Invoice No.
Date
Reference No.
Due Date

: INV-2274
: 03 Mar 2025
: SJN9944A
: 03 Mar 2025

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd

48 Toh Guan Rd East, #02-143/144/145/146/147, Singapore 608586
Tel: 8918 3288    Fax: 6722 8585
38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1, #05-18, Singapore 757700
Tel: 6468 8834    Fax: 6462 2278
Email: info@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg 
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201312913C PayNow UEN: 201312913C

TAX INVOICE
Bill Address
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
16 Raffles Quay, #42-01, Hong Leong Building
SINGAPORE 048581

Email: 
Phone No.: 

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE QUANTITY AMOUNT SGD

COST OF REPAIR (L/S) 2,600.00 1.00 2,600.00

Subtotal 2,600.00

GST 9% 234.00

Invoice Total SGD 2,834.00

Less: Payment Received SGD 0.00

Amount Due SGD 2,834.00

mailto:info@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg


Chen Joo Trading
UEN: 53168792M Tax Invoice

INVOICE TO: INVOICE NUMBER :
Dominic Chia Kim Seng (Xie JinCheng)
45A Edgefield Plains #06-04 DATE:
Singapore 828711

OUR VEHICLE NUMBER:

# DAYS RATE AMOUNT

Rental from 10/12/2024 to 17/12/2024 8 $100.00 $800.00
Your Reference: SJN9944A        

Account Name: Chen Joo Trading
Bank : UOB
Account number: 3923025756

All cheques must be made payable to CHEN JOO TRADING

*Please indicate invoice and vehicle number in the reference $800.00

Chen Joo Trading UEN: 53168792M
100 Jalan Sultan, #04-04, Sultan Plaza, Singpore (199001) Tel: 6294 8656

DESCRIPTION

Total

18/12/2024

241206

SLD9438Z
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg
Sent: Wednesday, June 4, 2025 2:10 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: 'ARC KenGuan'; 'razali'; 'James ARC'
Subject: RE: Agree DS thru LKK || MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ || ARC Ref: 

SJN9944A
Attachments: DV.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong, 
 
We are grateful for the revised offer. 
 
We accept settlement $3,534.00 (all-in) 
 
We enclosed herewith the signed DV, and our company’s bank details for your kind attention. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Company Name AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTE LTD 

Address 
38 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E1 #05-18 
SINGAPORE 757700 

Remittance Attention To 
Email & Contact Number 

INFO@AUTOMOTIVEREPAIRCENTRE.COM.SG 
6468 8834 

 
 

  
Bank Transfer Details  

  
Beneficiary AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTE LTD 

Bank Name 
OVERSEA-CHINESE BANKING CORPORATION 
LIMITED 

Bank Address 
65 CHULIA STREET OCBC CENTRE 
SINGAPORE 049513 

Bank Code 7339 

Branch Code 647 
SWIFT Code OCBCSGSG 
Bank Account No. 647603802001 
Currency SGD 

 
 
Regards, 
Shu Juan 
Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd  
38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 
#05-18 Singapore 757700 
Tel: +65 6468 8834   
Fax: +65 6462 2278 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2025 10:42 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Mandate Given - Agree DS thru LKK || MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ || 

ARC Ref: SJN9944A *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24120120/Tpa3

Dear Hsiao Tong,                                        
 
Mandate given from $3,334.00 to $3,534.00 
 
LOR to start from $100 X 5 days to 7 days  
 
Thanks. 
 

Best Regards 

Jason Tea 

Motor Claims Dept 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building| Singapore 048581 
D: 6359 1822| Tel: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 | Reg. No. 195000106C 
Website http://www,msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA 
Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, 
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately 
by return e-mail. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 March 2025 10:44 am 
To: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - Agree DS thru LKK || MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ || ARC Ref: SJN9944A 
*** LKK REF: CD/FCI24120120/Tpa3 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Your ref: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ 
Our ref : CD/FCI24120120/Tpa3q2(N) 
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Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC1677E(MS FCIL) AND SJN9944A(TP) ON 03/12/2024 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
It is a head-to-rear collision. We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTE LTD" at $3,534.00(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount 
Claimed 

Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (with GST) $ 8,901.94 $ 2,834.00 ($2,600.00 +9%GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $100.00)  $    800.00 $     700.00 (7days x $100.00) 

Total $ 9,701.94 $ 3,534.00 
   
Surveyor recommended 5days for repair + 1PRS + 1SUNDAY = 7DAYS. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 20/02/2025 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2024 5:04 PM 
To: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Agree DS thru LKK || MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ || ARC Ref: SJN9944A *** LKK REF: 
CD/FCI24120120/Tpa3 
 
Hi Jason, 
 
We refer to the above maƩer. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
•             TP esƟmated cost of repair  
•             Preliminary advice 
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•             Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condiƟon 
 
Please note that our officer in charge is Hsiao Tong. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Cheers to a Wonderful Christmas and a Happy New Year 2025 ! 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2024 2:14 PM 
To: james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) 
<daphnelee@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: 'shujuan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'ARC KenGuan' <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 
'razali' <razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg> 
Subject: Agree DS thru LKK || MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ || ARC Ref: SJN9944A 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear James,  
 
We agree DS Thru LKK subject to Quantum to be agreed and damage consistency.  
 

Best Regards 

Jason Tea 

Motor Claims Dept 

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building| Singapore 048581 
D: 6359 1822| Tel: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 | Reg. No. 195000106C 
Website http://www,msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA 
Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, 
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately 
by return e-mail. 
 

From: james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December 2024 11:49 am 



4

To: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Swee Keong Teo <SweeKeongTeo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'shujuan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 
'ARC KenGuan' <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'razali' <razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ || ARC Ref: SJN9944A 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening 
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Hi Jason, 
 
I had send you the documents needed for liability. 
 
Kindly let us know the liability ASAP. 
 
Thanks. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
 

 

James Tan 
Senior Claims Executive 
O +65 8081 3288 
E James@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg 
Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd 
48 Toh Guan Road East, #02-146 
Enterprise Hub, S608586 

 
 

From: james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg <james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 9 December 2024 10:44 am 
To: 'Jason Tea Chee Kiat' <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: 'Swee Keong Teo' <SweeKeongTeo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'shujuan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 
'ARC KenGuan' <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'razali' <razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ || ARC Ref: SJN9944A 
 
Hi Jason, 
 
Please find above attached for your reference. 
 
Kindly advise liability ASAP. 
 
Thanks. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
 



5

 

James Tan 
Senior Claims Executive 
O +65 8081 3288 
E James@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg 
Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd 
48 Toh Guan Road East, #02-146 
Enterprise Hub, S608586 

 
 

From: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 6 December 2024 8:34 am 
To: james@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg 
Cc: Swee Keong Teo <SweeKeongTeo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'shujuan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 
'ARC KenGuan' <kenguan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; 'razali' <razali@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg> 
Subject: MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ || ARC Ref: SJN9944A 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear James, 
 
For this case, we request for the accident video footage, esƟmate, GIA report and LeƩer Of AuthorisaƟon in order for us 
to reply on liability 
 
In future cases, if your need us to reply on liability, we will need the following:  
1) Accident Video Footage 
2) Repair EsƟmate 
3) LeƩer Of AuthorisaƟon 
 
With the above 3 items sent to us, it will be easier for us to do a quick Assessment and revert on liability. (unless our 
insured have not reported the accident to us) 
 
Please let all your colleagues know. 
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards 
Jason Tea 
Motor Claims Dept 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building| Singapore 048581 
D: 6359 1822| Tel: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 | Reg. No. 195000106C 
Website hƩp://www,msfirstcapital.com.sg 
 
 
Personal Data ProtecƟon Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
hƩp://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data CollecƟon Statement. 
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ConfidenƟality NoƟce: This e-mail is confidenƟal. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and noƟfy the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: james@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg <james@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2024 5:10 pm 
To: Swee Keong Teo <SweeKeongTeo@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 
shujuan@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg; kenguan@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg; 
razali@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ 
 
Hi All, 
 
Kindly advise liability. 
 
Thanks. 
 
Warmest Regards, 
 
 
James Tan 
Senior Claims ExecuƟve 
O +65 8081 3288 
E James@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg 
AutomoƟve Repair Centre Pte Ltd 
48 Toh Guan Road East, #02-146 
Enterprise Hub, S608586 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Swee Keong Teo <SweeKeongTeo@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2024 4:54 pm 
To: assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Joanne Tan Jo Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 
james@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg; 
shujuan@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg; 
kenguan@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg; razali@automoƟverepaircentre.com.sg 
Subject: NEW ASSIGNMENT MSFCIL REF: D24010639MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2/TJ 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
Please find aƩached documents for survey assignment. 
 
 
 
 
Insured Vehicle No : SHC1677E 
TP Vehicle No      : SJN9944A 
Claim No           : D24010639MFCT 



7

Workshop Name      : AUTOMOTIVE REPAIR CENTRE PTE LTD 
Our Surveyor       : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
InstrucƟons       : Without Prejudice - NO VIDEO, NO ESTIMATE 
 
Created By         : TEOSWEE 
Verified By        : JASONTEA 
Approved By        : JASONTEA 
 
 
 
This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail. 
 
 
 
 
 
-- 
This email has been checked for viruses by AVG anƟvirus soŌware. 
www.avg.com 
 

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free.www.avg.com 
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