Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Taufikh

Ok. we accept

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>

Tuesday, 15 April 2025 9:56 AM

Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Connect3 Kranji; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive); Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Re: Finalization for PC6372G

On Tue, Apr 15, 2025 at 9:45 AM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Please refer attached, COR /s $17,900, 8 days.

Subject to insurance approval



Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 14 April 2025 4:09 pm
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Winnie Chai (via Google Drive) <connect3winnie@gmail.com>; Connect3 Kranji <connect3office@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Finalization for PC6372G

Pls let us have the finalization.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road



(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Wed, Mar 19, 2025 at 10:12 AM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi

Pls let us have the finalization.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697

On Fri, Mar 7, 2025 at 2:36 PM Lau <connect3lau@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi



Attached is the after repair photos.

Pls let us have the finalization.

Thank you

Ms Lau

Tel: 8188 4136
Connect 3

566 Woodlands Road

(Mandai Estate) S 728697



