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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Claims @ Chia Auto Services <claims@chiaauto.sg>
Sent: Monday, 12 August 2024 10:45 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Cc: SUR
Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALIZE FOR SKZ8384Y-H.VEZEL-ACCIDENT ON 26/06/2024

Hi Veron, 
we confirm COR LS $10,000/- with 10 days of repair 
 
 
 

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

 

Ms Hong 

Chia Auto Services Pte Ltd  
E: claims@chiaauto.sg 
T: 6243 1373  F: 6243 1376  
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #04-01 Singapore 415933 

To help 
protect your 
privacy, 
Micro so ft 
Office 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet.

To help 
protect your 
privacy, 
Micro so ft 
Office 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet. 

 
On Tue, 6 Aug 2024 at 08:03, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Ms Hong, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Spoken to Xiao Hui on 5.8.2024, item no 17 Number plate lamp should be cancel-$170.00. 

  

We will be re-advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $10,000/- with 10 days of repair, subject to their approval. 

  

Sorry for the inconvenience caused 
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Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Claims @ Chia Auto Services <claims@chiaauto.sg>  
Sent: Friday, July 26, 2024 3:43 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: REQUEST FINALIZE FOR SKZ8384Y-H.VEZEL-ACCIDENT ON 26/06/2024 

  

Hi Veron,  

we confirm cor  LS $10,100/- with 10 days of repair, subject to their approval. 

*please refer attached AFTER REPAIR PHOTO for your reference 

  

 
 

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Ms Hong 
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Chia Auto Services Pte Ltd  
E: claims@chiaauto.sg 
T: 6243 1373  F: 6243 1376  
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #04-01 Singapore 415933 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 

  

On Fri, 26 Jul 2024 at 15:39, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Ms Hong, 

  

  

“Without Prejudice”  

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $10,100/- with 10 days of repair, subject to their 
approval.  

  

Kindly forward us after repair photos. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Claims @ Chia Auto Services <claims@chiaauto.sg>  
Sent: Friday, July 26, 2024 2:46 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: REQUEST FINALIZE FOR SKZ8384Y-H.VEZEL-ACCIDENT ON 26/06/2024 

  

Hi All, 

Please confirm the finalised amount and days with us. 

  

Please see the attached file After Repair Photo for your reference. 

  

  

  

 
 

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

  

Ms Hong 

Chia Auto Services Pte Ltd  
E: claims@chiaauto.sg 
T: 6243 1373  F: 6243 1376  
23 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #04-01 Singapore 415933 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 


