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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 5 March 2025 12:32 PM
To: rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: YR1307T FINALISE
Attachments: YR1307T_FINALISE ESTIMATE.pdf

Hi Minoko, 
 
COR l/s $2500 , 4 days. 
 
Subject to insurance approval. 
 
Regards 
Taufikh 
Lkk Auto 
 
 

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 March 2025 1:18 pm 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: YR1307T FINALISE 
 
Dear Taufikh, 
 
Kindly assist. (Rasul’s case) 
 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler 

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg <rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 4 March 2025 12:17 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: rnsautoclaim@rnseng.com.sg 
Subject: YR1307T FINALISE 
 
Without Prejudice, 
 
Dear In-charge, 
 
Kindly check & confirm the finalise COR @ $ 2,500.00 (before GST) and 4 repair days (excluding PRS/RS/PH/Weekend)  
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Thank You 
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Minoko Chan 
R&S Autoclaim Pte. Ltd. 
13 Pioneer Sector 1 Singapore 628424 
 
: +65 6264 7001 | HP: +65 8506 6490 |  : 6264 7002 
 


