




                                                                                                                                                       

CLAIM NO : 24/24/24/VC05/030175
DATE  : 11 JUNE 2025

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/We, ACE MARINE SUPPLIES PTE. LTD. confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or owner of YQ2092K the sum of Singapore 
Dollar Two Thousand Four Hundred Eighty-One And Cents Ninety-Three Only
($2,481.93) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of all property losses
competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of all
property losses sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest, 
arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving GBD5503M and 
YQ2092K on 11/11/2024 along/at BOON LAY WAY TOWARDS BOON LAY MRT 
(JURONG POINT).

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE BHD/
ASSOCIATED ENTERPRISE (S) PTE LTD1979 AND/OR LEE TECK HEONG) 
against all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf 
in respect of the said accident.

I/We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to “ASM
AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD”.

I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our insured’s 
recovery action.

……… ……………………………..
Signature of vehicle owner/Date

……………………………………..
Name of vehicle owner /Date

Ace Marine Supplies Pte Ltd/ 16Jun25

16/6/2025
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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 June 2025 9:16 AM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030175 - Third Party Claim --- GBD5503M and YQ2092K 

(Your ref.) ; DOA: 11.11.2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24110597/Tma3

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Daphne, 
 
You have our mandate to settle as follow. 
 
Cost of repair $1,962.00 
Loss of use $517.75 
GIA fee $2.18 
Total $2,481.93 

 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 6 June 2025 2:17 pm 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030175 - Third Party Claim --- GBD5503M and YQ2092K (Your ref.) ; DOA: 
11.11.2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24110597/Tma3 
 

Lonpac External - General 
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