Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO®@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 June 2025 9:16 AM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030175 - Third Party Claim --- GBD5503M and YQ2092K

(Your ref.) ; DOA: 11.11.2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24110597/Tma3

Lonpac External - General

Dear Daphne,

You have our mandate to settle as follow.

Cost of repair $1,962.00

Loss of use $517.75

GIA fee $2.18

Total $2,481.93
Thank you.

Best Regards

Eric Woo

Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee @Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 June 2025 2:17 pm

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030175 - Third Party Claim --- GBD5503M and YQ2092K (Your ref.) ; DOA:
11.11.2024 *** KK REF: CD/LPC24110597/Tma3

Lonpac External - General

Caution: This email is from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments if you do not recognize the sender.



