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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2024 3:36 PM
To: Bazlin Ahmad
Cc: logeswaran chandra; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB3537J & PC5725D ON 23/11/2024 @ 13:20HRS ALONG 

ANSON RD BEF JUNCT WITH MAXWELL RD

Hi Bazlin, 
 
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $11,541.18 /- with 07 days of repair before GST, subject to 
their approval. 
 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 
 

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 26 December 2024 2:39 pm 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: logeswaran chandra <logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB3537J & PC5725D ON 23/11/2024 @ 13:20HRS ALONG ANSON RD BEF JUNCT 
WITH MAXWELL RD  
  
Hi Rasul  
Please find attached and kindly finalise soonest.  
  
Thank You 
  
  
  
Best Regards 

 
Manager, Claims 
Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, December 4, 2024 9:25 AM 
To: logeswaran chandra <logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg> 
Cc: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>; Wei Siong Liam <WeiSiong.Liam@towertransit.sg>; Yong Wei Tan 
<Yongwei.Tan@towertransit.sg> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB3537J & PC5725D ON 23/11/2024 @ 13:20HRS ALONG ANSON RD BEF JUNCT 
WITH MAXWELL RD 
  
[EXTERNAL EMAIL]  
Hi Logan, 
  
ok 
  
  
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

  
  

From: logeswaran chandra <logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg> 
Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2024 3:51 pm 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>; Wei Siong Liam <WeiSiong.Liam@towertransit.sg>; Yong Wei Tan 
<Yongwei.Tan@towertransit.sg> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMB3537J & PC5725D ON 23/11/2024 @ 13:20HRS ALONG ANSON RD BEF JUNCT WITH 
MAXWELL RD  
  
Dear Rasul, 
  
Please refer attached Estimate. Please send us back the marked copy. Thank you. 
  
Rgds, 
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Logan 

Claims Executive 
Email  : logeswaran.chandra@towertransit.sg 
  

 
Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd 
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170 
Registration number 201419417K 
www.towertransit.sg 
  
  
[Security Reminder] This email was sent from outside the organisation - please use 
caution when clicking on links or opening attachments. 


