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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: AKA AUTO <akaautopte@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 24 June 2025 1:17 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: TP SND 8247R DOA: 23/11/2024

Hi Shiau 
 
Yes noted,  
Thank you so much. 
 
On Mon, Jun 23, 2025 at 5:11 PM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Fyn, 

  

Any status as below? 

  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler 

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 18 June 2025 4:51 PM 
To: akaautopte@gmail.com 
Subject: TP SND 8247R DOA: 23/11/2024 

  

Dear Fyn, 

  



2

Without prejudice 

 
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of Lump Sum $5,100.00 with 6 days of repair, subject to 
their approval. 

  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler 

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


