Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:
Subject:

Dear Huey Yon

Au Kin Cheong <choonhockmotor@gmail.com>
Wednesday, 18 December 2024 1:54 PM

Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Re: SMF 8214L-DOA:16/11/2024

Revised lump sum amount amount of $3,050.00 with 4 days of repair is accepted.

Thank you.

Jacqueline Tan

On 18 Dec 2024, at 1:39 PM, Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Re-send

Without prejudice

We will be re-advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $3,050.00 before GST with 4 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Wonderjul Chnistmas Fappy New Year 2025

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.
Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 9:26 AM
To: choonhock@gmail.com

Subject: RE: SMF 8214L-DOA:16/11/2024

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Re-send

Without prejudice

We will be re-advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $3,050.00 before GST with 4 days of
repair, subject to their approval.



Cheers to a Wonderful Chnistmas and a Fappy Wew Year 2025

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 16 December 2024 12:32 PM
To: choonhock@gmail.com

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SMF 8214L-DOA:16/11/2024

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Without prejudice

We will be re-advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $3,050.00 before GST with 4 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Cheers to a Wonderful Chnistmas and a Fappy Wew Year 2025

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933




