Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 25 July 2025 3:42 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Autolnsure

Subject: RE: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE-DOA: 22/11/2024
Hi Veron,

We confirm the total COR $13,000(before gst) with 9 days

Thank You

Regards,
Ck Loh

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | é Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com

borneomotors
> For the road ahead

@ inchcape

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, July 25, 2025 3:30 PM

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE-DOA: 22/11/2024

Dear Mr Loh,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $13,000/- with 9 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 July 2025 2:29 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE

Hi Veron,

Any updates ?

Thank You

Regards,

Ck Loh

Claims Estimator

Century Moftors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | é Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com

borneomotors

For the road ahead

@ inchcape

From: Autolnsure

Sent: Wednesday, July 16, 2025 3:31 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE

Hi Veron,

The repair limit $13,000 given on 3 Dec 2024, please recheck.

-

/>



Sent: Tuesday, 2 December 20
To: Chen Khuan Loh
Cc: Autolnsure <claim

This Message Is From an External Sender

This message came from outside your organization.

Hi CK,

For this case, your side able to repair within the limit of $13,000?

Regards
Taufikh
Lkl Auto

Thank You

Regards,

Ck Loh

Claims Estimator

Century Moftors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | é Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com

borneomotors
For the road ahead

@ inchcape

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, May 16, 2025 2:01 PM

To: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE

Dear Mr Loh,

Any update?

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler



Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 May 2025 11:33 AM

To: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE

Dear Mr Loh,

Any update?

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 24 April 2025 3:08 PM

To: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE

Dear Mr Loh,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $7,600 with 9 days of repair, subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 February 2025 2:35 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE




Hi Taufikh,

Please help us to finalize this case soon.

Thank You

Regards,

Ck Loh

Claims Estimator

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | é Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com

@) Inchcape

inchcape

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2024 9:47 AM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SLN598B TP CLAIM REQUEST FINALISE

Hi Taufikh,

We have attached the after paint photos and supplementary list for your review.

Please let us have your offer soon.

Thank You

Regards,

Ck Loh

Claims Estimator

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | é Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com

@) Inchcape

inchcape

From: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2024 10:44 am
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>




Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLN 598B REPAIR LIMIT

Hi Taufikh,

Yes, we will repair below the limit 13k.

Thank You

Regards,

Ck Loh

Claims Estimator

Century Motors (Singapore) Pte Ltd | é Marsiling Lane, Singapore 739145.
Tel: +65 3157 2631

Mobile: +65 9743 6363

www.inchcape.com

POWERING

@ Inchcape /%) .
MO‘B' Lﬁv inchcape

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2024 10:42 am

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>

Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLN 598B REPAIR LIMIT

Hi CK,
For this case, your side able to repair within the limit of $13,0007?

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2024 6:09 pm

To: Chen Khuan Loh <ChenKhuan.Loh@autoinsure.com.sg>
Cc: Autolnsure <claims@autoinsure.com.sg>

Subject: SLN 598B REPAIR LIMIT

Hi CK,
Please take note repair limit for this car is $13,000.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto



