Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2025 10:22 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD) - FINALISATION CONFIRMED

From: CYS <cysauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2025 10:21:34 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD) - FINALISATION CONFIRMED

Dear Ms Shiau Chan, WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Refer tele-conversation a moment ago.
We are agreed repair cost at $11,400 based on lump sum.

Please inform us once you update on Merimen system. Thanks

Regards,
Ms Tee Wee Sin

\ / CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD
‘ a 38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 #07-17 S(757700)

Tel: 62192098 Fax: 62192096
Email: cysauto@singnet.com.sg

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 February 2025 10:17 am

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; cysauto@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD) - FINALISATION & PHOTOS - REMINDER

Dear Wee Sin,

Any status as below email?

Wishing You a Prosperous & Joyful Chinese New Year 2025

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 6 February 2025 10:47 PM

To: cysauto@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD) - FINALISATION & PHOTOS - REMINDER

Hi Wee Sin,
Please refer attached, COR /s $11400, 4 days.
Subject to insurance approval.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 February 2025 3:02 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD) - FINALISATION & PHOTOS - REMINDER

Dear Taufikh,

FYNA.

Wishing You a Prosperous & Joyful Chinese New Year 2025

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler

Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 10 January 2025 4:21 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD) - FINALISATION & PHOTOS - REMINDER

From: CYS <cysauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 10 January 2025 4:20:33 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD) - FINALISATION & PHOTOS - REMINDER

Dear Mr Taufikh, WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Kindly check and let us have your confirmation.



Thanks

Regards,
Ms Tee Wee Sin
\ / CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD
‘ ‘ 38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 #07-17 S(757700)
Tel: 62192098 Fax: 62192096

Email: cysauto@singnet.com.sg

From: CYS [mailto:cysauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2024 11:51 am

To: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD) - FINALISATION & PHOTOS

Dear Mr Taufikh, WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Attached herewith estimate and after repair photos for your attention.
I have calculate the repair cost at $12,500 based on lump sum.

Kindly check and confirm. Thanks and look forward for your reply.

Regards,
Ms Tee Wee Sin

Y
——

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) [mailto:celinefong@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 29 November 2024 1:52 pm

To: CYS <cysauto@singnet.com.sg>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SMN 1974E-DOA: 24/11/2024 (ECICS OD)

CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD
38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 #07-17 S(757700)

Tel: 62192098 Fax: 62192096

Email: cysauto@singnet.com.sg

Dear Wee Sin,

As instructed by our client, please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMN 1974E. Lump Sum repair Not Exceeding
$15,000.00 or whichever lower.
(Excess 0).

If there are any check items or supplementary items, please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 6741 8434 to
arrange our surveyor for inspection.



All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company before
completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserves their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,

Celine Fong on behalf of Shiau Chan

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



