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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 31 July 2025 10:41 AM
To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha
Subject: **WITHDRAW CLAIM** - SNJ5899Y & SFN71A (DOA: 05/06/2024) ***LKK Ref: 

CD/AIG24060003/Uma3(N) | AIG Ref: 4406315762SG
Attachments: AIG_LKKInvoice1_AC2504960 (SNJ5899Y).pdf

Dear Saliha, 
 
Refer to the above matter 
 
Please be informed that workshop updated TP has withdrawn claim. 
 
TP vehicle no survey done by LKK and submit our invoice to bill Merimen fee. 
 
 
Thank you 
 

For future correspondence, please remove meikwan@lkkauto.com and admin-a@lkkauto.com in your email. Thanks. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: info@speedwerkz.biz
Sent: Wednesday, 30 July 2025 2:39 PM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR SNJ 5899Y & YOUR REF: SFN 71A DOA ON 

05.06.2024

Dear Daphne 
 
This vehicle withdraw 
 
Best regards 
Julie 
 
 
 
 
-------- Original Message -------- 
Subject: REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR SNJ 5899Y & YOUR REF: SFN 71A DOA ON  
05.06.2024 
Date: 10/06/2024 09:12 
 From: info@speedwerkz.biz 
To: AIGSGP ClaimsSurvey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com> 
 
Dear Sir/Madam 
 
"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" 
 
Kindly arrange surveyor to inspect our client vehicle at 
 
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
#01-73 Autobay@Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
 
Person in Charge - Kent (9619 5936) 
 
WE WOULD LIKE TO HAVE LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD FOR THE INSPECTION. 
 
Hear from you soon. 
 
Regards, 
 
Julie (Claim Department) 
SpeedWerkz Pte Ltd 
ROC: 202127390C 
Add: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
#01-73 Autobay@Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
DID: 90996204 


