Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 6:34 AM

To: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto); Admin A; assignments

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: OREF: 24/24/24/VC05/030227 Motor claim involving PC8628G and YP8952U DOA:
18.10.2024

Attachments: YP8952U.pdf

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Hueh Yin,

Attached OI report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2024 9:56 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assighments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: OREF: 24/24/24/VC05/030227 Motor claim involving PC8628G and YP8952U DOA: 18.10.2024

Lonpac External - General

Dear Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that the vehicle notin the workshop, repairer will arrange.
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Best Regards,
Hueh Yin | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, November 27, 2024 8:50 AM

To: assignments <assignments@l|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Tricia Woo
<tricia.onelinemotorworks@gmail.com>

Subject: FW: OREF: 24/24/24/VC05/030227 Motor claim involving PC8628G and YP8952U DOA: 18.10.2024

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Hueh Yin,
FYNA.
Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Chiang Xue Feng <tricia.onelinemotorworks@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 November 2024 8:42 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Subject: Re: OREF: 24/24/24/VC05/030227 Motor claim involving PC8628G and YP8952U DOA: 18.10.2024
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Without Prejudice

Hi,
Thank you for your email.

We choose LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Kindly advise on the date of survey and the estimated timing.

Our workshop address is 11 Tuas Bay Close #06-03 West Star.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

On Mon, Nov 25, 2024 at 12:45 PM GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General
Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Xue Feng,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and enclose the names
of our Motor surveyor firms your attention:-

1. FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd
2. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days.



Best Regards

Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Chiang Xue Feng <tricia.onelinemotorworks@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2024 8:42 am

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: Motor claim involving PC8628G and YP8952U DOA: 18.10.2024

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Hi Sir/Mdm,

Kindly refer to attached documents regarding the accident

Kindly do provide us with the surveyor list.

Much appreciated.



Best Regards,
Chiang Xue Feng
Admin Assistance

One Line MotorworksTrading

€3 +65 62622106

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Best Regards,
Chiang Xue Feng
Admin Assistance

One Line MotorworksTrading

€8 +65 62622106



