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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Yan (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, February 24, 2025 2:39 PM
To: Emily Tan Su Min
Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24010275MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) *** LKK REF:  CD/FCI24110505/Rua3 
Attachments: SNP8686T - LOD.pdf; LKK SURVEY REPORT & PHOTOS.pdf

Your ref: D24010275MFCT 
Our ref : CD/FCI24110505/Rua3 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC2403Y(MS FCIL) AND SNP8686T(TP) ON 21/11/2024 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We are of the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour as insured follow too close and rear ended third party when 
turning out to main road from minor road. 
  
We seek your approval to offer repairer “EUROKARS AUTO PTE LTD" at $ 5,571.84(all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
   

Amount Claimed Amount Revised 
1. Cost of Repair  $      7,579.90 $ 5,209.66 ($4,779.50+9%GST) 
2. Loss of Use (3days x $120.00) $         360.00 $     360.00 (3DAYS X $120.00) 
3. GIA / LTA search fee $             2.18 $         2.18 

Total $     7,942.08 $ 5,571.84 
   
Surveyor recommended 3 days for repair. 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 23/01/2025 is only for mandate purpose. 
  
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction. 
 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 
Yan 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, December 3, 2024 6:55 PM 
To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24010275MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24110505/Rua3  
 
Hi Emily, 
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We refer to the above maƩer. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
•             TP esƟmated cost of repair  
•             Preliminary advice 
•             Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condiƟon 
 
Please note that our officer in charge is Yan. 
 
Cheers to a Wonderful Christmas and a Happy New Year 2025 ! 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Betty Wong <BettyWong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, November 25, 2024 2:34 PM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Oh Hui Wen <huiwen.oh@eurokars.com.sg>; ESPL Claims Admin <claims.espl@eurokars.com.sg>; Jerome Tan ZL 
<jerome.tan.zl@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Yao Sheng <yaosheng.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Jason Wong 
<jason.wong@eurokars.com.sg>; Lee Jun Xian <junxian.lee@eurokars.com.sg>; Eric Paul Glorioso 
<eric.glorioso@eurokars.com.sg>; Manojj Baloo <manojj.baloo@porsche.com.sg>; Muhammad Nur Faiz Bin Sanat 
<faiz.sanat@porsche.com.sg>; Joseph Tee YS <joseph.tee.ys@eurokars.com.sg>; Ahmad Faisal Bin Hamid 
<faisal.hamid@eurokars.com.sg>; Jobi Thomas <jobi.thomas@eurokars.com.sg>; Vion Lim LS 
<vion.lim.ls@eurokars.com.sg>; Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Subject: NEW ASSIGNMENT (OUR REF: D24010275MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 ) 
 
Insured Vehicle No : SHC2403Y 
TP Vehicle No      : SNP8686T 
Claim No           : D24010275MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2 
Workshop Name      : EUROKARS GROUP 
Our Surveyor       : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD 
InstrucƟons       : Direct SeƩlement 
(SUBJECTED TO QUANTUM TO BE AGREED) 
Created By         : BETTYWON 
Verified By        : EMILYTAN 
Approved By        : EMILYTAN 
 
 
 
This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail. 
 
 
 


