Hueh Yin (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2024 3:54 PM

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo; Natarajan Kavidha Rajan

Subject: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10030201/KR || OI-SKW906K (White) TP-SMH8365Z || Ests:
$0.00 || Profi Automotive

Attachments: C10030201 SMH8365Z.zip

Importance: High

Dear Team,

We would like to request TP survey for TP VEH NO SMH8365Z. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.
Workshop:

Profi Automotive

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2,
#01-05, First East Centre,
Singapore 4175868

M: 94335558

E: profi.automotive@asia.com

Please confirm assignment.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Michael
Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3704
F +65 6725 0853
E jinghou.chin@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose
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insurance feefo

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg



auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: Profi Automotive <profi.automotive@asia.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 3:41 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request 27.06.2024 || C10030201/KR | | RE: accident involving SKW906K/SMH8365Z on 10/6/24
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Michael,
Our choice is LKK.

KINDLY BE REMINDED OF THE CHANGE OF OUR ADDRESS AS STATED BELOW.
10 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 2 #01-05, FIRST EAST CENTRE. SINGAPORE 417868.

Warmest regards,
Edward Ow

Profi Automotive

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2,

#01-05, First East Centre,
Singapore 417868

M: 94335558

E: profi.automotive@asia.com

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2024 4:59 PM

To: Profi Automotive <profi.automotive@asia.com>; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: YOU REF : SMH8365Z | | AGI REF : SKW906K | | DOA : 10.06.2024
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Dear Sirs,

We refer to your email on 20/06/2024.

Please let us have your client’s GIA report, for our claim registration.
Please take note our insured has yet to report the accident.
Thankyou.

Warmest Regards,

Chang Shi Qian
Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3707

F +65 6725 0853
E shigian.chang@budgetdirect.com.sg

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.



From: Profi Automotive <profi.automotive@asia.com>
Sent: Thursday, June 20, 2024 3:04 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Notice of accident | | SMH8365Z against SKW906K
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir,

Please see the attached.

Warmest regards,
Edward Ow

Profi Automotive

10 Kaki Bukit Road 2,
#01-05, First East Centre,
Singapore 417868

M: 94335558

E: profi.automotive@asia.com




