Hueh Yin (LKK Auto)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2024 2:32 PM

To: admin-d; SUR; assignments

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Rick Teo; Ng Chen How

Subject: TPPD Survey : Claim Ref: C10030181/CH || OI-SLK6196D (Grey) TP-SGM159A || Ests:
$0.00 || Kai Motor Trading

Attachments: C10030181 SGM159A.zip

Dear Team,

We would like to request TP survey for TP VEH NO SGM159A. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop:

Kai Motor Trading

Elk 2007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Please confirm assignment.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Michael
Executive, Claims Administration

T +65 6989 3704
F +65 6725 0853
E jinghou.chin@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose

BudQEt Platinum Trusted
DI'.I"ECt Service Award
insurance feefo

Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg




auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 1:07 PM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PRI Request 27.06.2024 || C10030181/CH | | RE: accident involving SLK6196D/SGM159A on 26/6/24

Hi Michael,

Thanks for your email.

Please be informed that we have chosen LKK to conduct a pre-repair surveyor.
With best regards,

Wendy

From: Kai Motor <kaimotor@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 10:48 AM

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Accident Involved Vehicle Toyota Harrierd SGM159A And SLK6196D on 26/06/2024 at 08:10

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1
#01-440, SINGAPORE 408701
TEL: 67474006 FAX:67437591
E-mail : kaimotor@gmail.com
REG NO: 44223100L
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Date: 05/09/2022

Attn: The Motor Claims Department
Your Insured Vehicle - SLK 6196 D

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd

190 Clemenceau Ave #03-01 Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore 239924

Tel: 62212199

Email: Claims@budgetdirect.com.sg

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam

Accident Involved Vehicle Toyota Harrierd SGM159A And SLK6196D on 26/06/2024 at 08:10

We are writing on behalf of TAN AH HEE the registered
owner of SGM 159 A which was involved on the above mentioned accident between SLK 196 D.

Investigation reveals that the motor vehicle number SLK 196 D was insured with you at the
material time of the said accident.

As a result of the accident was caused solely and completely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle number SLK 196 D Therefore, our client is holding you liable for the repair costs and
other consequential loss which was sustained by him/her/them.

Kindly arrange your representative to survey our client’s vehicle at KAl MOTOR TRADING

Blk 3007, Ubi Road 1, #01-440, Singapore 408701 within two (2) days from the date hereof as
to avoid further losses incur.

We enclosed hereby the GIA report of SGM 159 A for your kind attention.

Failing which, our client have no alternative but to proceed with the necessary repairs and
the will be forward to you for reimbursement.

Yours faithfully,

Have a nice day with thanks.



REFRFH—K.

Ms Kim
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006

Have a nice day with thanks.

PUIER REFH— K.

Ms Kim
Kai Motor Trading

Blk 3007 Ubi Rd 1 #01-440
Singapore 408701
Telephone: 6747 4006



