Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Lincoln Tan <claims@ 1axisworkshop.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2024 1:10 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: After Paint Photos for SMR9729Z

Dear Mr Rasul,
Duly noted.
Thank you so much

Regards,
Lincoln

Sent from Outlook for Android

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, July 4, 2024 1:00:12 pm

To: Lincoln Tan <claims@1axisworkshop.com.sg>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: After Paint Photos for SMR9729Z

Hi Lincoln,
As per our message,

We will be advising our principal a revised cost of repair P/P $700.00 /- with 03 days of repair before GST,
subject to their approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the ELarth: Frint only wher necessary-

From: Lincoln Tan <claims@ laxisworkshop.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2024 12:28 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: After Paint Photos for SMR9729Z

Dear Mr Rasul,
Attached herewith the after paint photos for your perusal.

Thank you.



Lincoln Tan
1Axis Workshop Pte Ltd
93213888



