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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Irene Tay (CTPIS) <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Friday, 22 November 2024 1:39 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Cc: Eddie Sim (CTPIS)
Subject: FW: OD - SLU 9006Y (YOUR REF: SNM24D206258)

[Internal] 

 
Dear Sir/Mdm (LKK), 
  
Please proceed with the approval from our in-house  
  
Repair cost ok, $3,324.80. 
  
Regards, 
  
Irene Tay 
  
  
From: Eddie Sim (CTPIS) <eddie.sim@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Friday, 22 November 2024 11:35 am 
To: Irene Tay (CTPIS) <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: OD - SLU 9006Y (YOUR REF: SNM24D206258) 
  

[Internal] 

  
Hi Irene, 
  
Repair cost ok, $3,324.80. 
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Thanks 
                                                                                                                                                                            
Regards, 
  
  
 Eddie Sim 
 Claims Department 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 6389 6173   |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
  
  
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmiƩed with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidenƟal informaƟon. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or disseminaƟon of this message, either in whole or parƟal, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please 
noƟfy the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereaŌer. 
  
  
From: Irene Tay (CTPIS) <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Friday, 22 November 2024 11:31 am 
To: Eddie Sim (CTPIS) <eddie.sim@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: FW: OD - SLU 9006Y (YOUR REF: SNM24D206258) 
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[Internal] 

  
Dear Eddie, 
  
Please assist to vet thru and let me have your approval. 
  
Regards, 
  
Irene Tay  
  
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 21 November 2024 3:17 pm 
To: Irene Tay (CTPIS) <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Eddie Sim (CTPIS) <eddie.sim@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; SUR 
<sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: OD - SLU 9006Y (YOUR REF: SNM24D206258) 
  

  

Dear Irene, 
  
Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLU 9006Y. 
The vehicle repair on part by part basis due to no 2nd hand parts available. 
We have not authorize repair. 
  
Kindly advise on authorizaƟon. 
  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Senior Case Handler 
Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  


