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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 11:26 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SLL1552L-XIN YUN AUTO

Hi Yuey Yon, pls help me submit $1800. 

I will contact the officer for settlement, thanks. 

 

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

 

 

On Tue, Dec 17, 2024 at 11:19 AM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

NTUC officer email- helena.tan@income.com.sg 

  

Cheers to a Wonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful Christmas    and a    Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025 !   

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2024 11:10 AM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLL1552L-XIN YUN AUTO 
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Hi Yuey Yon,  

Good afternoon. 

Do you have this case's NTUC officer email? I want to ask him/her for a quick settlement, as the 

repair amount is low. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Tue, Dec 17, 2024 at 10:06 AM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

Re-send 

  

“Without Prejudice”  

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $1,800.00 /- with 3 days of repair, subject to their 

approval.  

  

Cheers to a Wonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful Christmas    and a    Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025 !   

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
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Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 2 December 2024 4:28 PM 

To: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: SLL1552L-XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

Any updates? 

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2024 11:16 AM 

To: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SLL1552L-XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

“Without Prejudice”  

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $1,800.00 /- with 3 days of repair, subject to their 

approval.  
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Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2024 11:00 AM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLL1552L-XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Hi Huey Yon, good day to you.  

Final pictures attached, pls help me for the finalise, appreciate your help :) 

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Fri, Nov 22, 2024 at 9:30 AM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Huey Yon, sure, Monday i send to you ya, thanks. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 
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On Fri, Nov 22, 2024 at 8:43 AM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

Kindly provide us after paint photos. 

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 21 November 2024 5:58 PM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLL1552L-XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Hi Huey Yon, good afternoon, SLL1552L help me finalise asap. thanks. 

Client may consider selling the vehicle, so we quickly settled it asap, thanks. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Thu, Nov 21, 2024 at 3:36 PM Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Huey Yon, fyi...estimate for your reference, thanks. 
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Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Thu, Nov 21, 2024 at 2:36 PM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

The case handler is Huey Yon. 

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 21 November 2024 2:18 PM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SLL1552L-XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Hi Huey Yon and Veron, 

  

Good afternoon, can i check with you this case's case handler, thanks. 

  

Surveyor is Adrian, i will submit the surveyor's marking in a while, thanks. 
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Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 


