Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Soon Lee VMS <soonlee@completevms.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 13 December 2024 5:57 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Tian Yuh Sia; Jia En Leong; Darren Chiu; Gan Li Hui; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Request for finalized | SNJ2007A DOA:17/11/2024

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

We accept your offer COR $10,007.00 (P/P, before GST)

I — Complete VMS Pte. Ltd.

5, Soon Lee Street, #01-54, Pioneer Point, S627607
D (65) 6555 6111
W https://www.completevms.com.sg

On Mon, Dec 9, 2024 at 11:33 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Sir,

Kindly refer our amend finalize $10,007.00 (P/P, before GST). 12 days (Subject to insurance approval)

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Soon Lee VMS <soonlee@completevms.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 9 December 2024 2:04 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Tian Yuh Sia <sia@completevms.com.sg>; Jia En Leong <jiaen@completevms.com.sg>; Darren Chiu
<darren@completevms.com.sg>; Gan Li Hui <lihui@completevms.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Request for finalized | SNJ2007A DOA:17/11/2024

Without Prejudice

Dear Steve,

Please see the attached marking estimate and supplementary.

Please re-calculate the finalise amount,

Thank you

I — Complete VMS Pte. Ltd.

5, Soon Lee Street, #01-54, Pioneer Point, S627607
D (65) 6555 6111
W https://www.completevms.com.sg

On Fri, Dec 6, 2024 at 7:35 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Sir,

Kindly refer our finalize $9118.44 (P/P, Before GST). 12 days. (Subject to insurance approval)



Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Soon Lee VMS <soonlee@completevms.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 6 December 2024 1:34 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Tian Yuh Sia <sia@completevms.com.sg>; Jia En Leong <jiaen@completevms.com.sg>; Darren Chiu
<darren@completevms.com.sg>; Gan Li Hui <lihui@completevms.com.sg>

Subject: Request for finalized | SNJ2007A DOA:17/11/2024

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Mdm,

Please find the above After Repair photo.

Please Finalize and kindly provide a calculated final estimate

Thank you

£ E— Complete VMS Pte. Ltd.

5, Soon Lee Street, #01-54, Pioneer Point, S627607
D (65) 6555 6111
W https://www.completevms.com.sg







