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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 15 July 2024 1:35 PM
To: Sim
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Final Bill for SMK3959C
Attachments: SMK3959C Final Bill_240715_133345.pdf

 
Hi Sim, 
 
COR l/s $6500 , 3 days. 
 
Subject to insurance approval 
 
Regards 
Taufikh 
Lkk Auto 
 

From: Sim <ST.Sim@autobacs.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, July 15, 2024 12:25 PM 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin <admin@autobacs.com.sg> 
Subject: Re: Final Bill for SMK3959C 
 
Dear Sir 
 
Attached final bill for your approval 
 

Best Regards, 

 

S.T. Sim 

Claims & Admin Manager 

 

AUTOBACS CAR CARE SINGAPORE PTE LTD 

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #08-40/45/46  

 Premier @Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875 

Tel: +65 9844 0974 

Email: ST.Sim@autobacs.com.sg 


