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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: DACC Mahirah <mahirah@dacc.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 12 December 2024 8:19 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: choonxiang@dacc.com.sg; 'Randell Goon Wei Fatt'; 'Siew Ying'; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SNM 701B - Finalize

Hi Mr Steve,  

 

Yes we confirm the following. 

 

Thank you! 

 

MIRA 

Administration Officer 

Dickson Auto Care Centre Pte Ltd  

(A member of the Dickson Group)  

29 Ubi Road 4, Dickson Auto Centre, Singapore 408619 

T: 6668 1122 | F: 6668 1123 | E: mahirah@dacc.com.sg |24/7 Roadside Assistance: 6668 1129 

www.dicksongroup.com.sg 

 
DISCLAIMER: This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity named 

above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any 

dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in 

error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original. Views expressed are those of the individual sender, 

and not necessarily the views of Dickson Group Pte Ltd and or any of its related corporations. 

 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2024 11:48 pm 

To: DACC Mahirah <mahirah@dacc.com.sg> 

Cc: choonxiang@dacc.com.sg; 'Randell Goon Wei Fatt' <randellgoon@dacc.com.sg>; 'Siew Ying' 

<siewying@dacc.com.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SNM 701B - Finalize 

 

Hi Mira, 

 

Kindly follow up the finalize. 

 

 

 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Sunday, 8 December 2024 10:38 am 

To: DACC Mahirah <mahirah@dacc.com.sg> 

Cc: choonxiang@dacc.com.sg; 'Randell Goon Wei Fatt' <randellgoon@dacc.com.sg>; 'Siew Ying' 

<siewying@dacc.com.sg>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SNM 701B - Finalize 
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Hi Mira, 

 

Kindly refer our finalize $9200.00 (L/S, before GST). 6 days. (Subject to insurance approval) 

 

Please confirm. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks and regards, 

Steve Chen 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


