Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 November 2024 10:52 AM

To: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto); Admin A; assignments

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: OREF: 23/24/24/VC06/030181 FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR VEHICLE SKW8228G &
YN4633C DOA 14/11/2024

Attachments: YN4633C (2).pdf

Categories: HMK

Lonpac External - General

Lonpac External - General

Dear Hueh Yin,

Attached OI report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 18 November 2024 10:41 am

To: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR VEHICLE SKW8228G & YN4633C DOA 14/11/2024

Lonpac External - General

Dear Charmaine,

Thank you for the assignment.



Best Regards,
Hueh Yin | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, November 18, 2024 10:15 AM

To: Elite Auto Restoration Pte Ltd <eliteautorestore.sg@gmail.com>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR VEHICLE SKW8228G & YN4633C DOA 14/11/2024

Lonpac External - General
Lonpac External - General

Dear Huey Yin (LKK),
Please arrange survey.

Our insured has yet to file the report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong

Claims Officer | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.268 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Elite Auto Restoration Pte Ltd <eliteautorestore.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 18 November 2024 10:09 am

To: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@I|onpac.com>

Subject: Re: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR VEHICLE SKW8228G & YN4633C DOA 14/11/2024

Dear Charmaine
We would like to appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the pre-repair inspection.

Thanks
Nancy

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

On Fri, Nov 15, 2024 at 5:15 PM CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com> wrote:

Lonpac External - General
Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

Our insured has yet to file the report.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and enclose the names of our Motor
surveyor firms for your attention:-

1. FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd



2. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong

Claims Officer | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.268 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

HEW . |onpac

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days.

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

From: Elite Auto Restoration Pte Ltd <eliteautorestore.sg@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 November 2024 5:02 pm

To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@I|onpac.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR VEHICLE SKW8228G & YN4633C DOA 14/11/2024




Dear Officerin charge,

We are appointed by a workshop bearing the car plates SKW8228G,an accident happened due to the collision by your insured
YN4633C.

Kindly help to advise if your insured SKW8228G reported the accident, and help to register the
claim.

Our company details is as follow:
Elite Auto Restoration Pte Ltd
No 23 Kaki Bukit ave 4
#04-01
S(415933)

Regards,

Allan

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.



