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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Seloshinah Sinivasagam <seloshinah@motorimage.net>
Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2024 11:59 AM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: LKINSTEAM
Subject: OUR REF: SNG8913K YOUR REF: SHD4401J DOA: 21 JUN 2024 TP - PENDING 

PAYMENT
Attachments: SNG8913K LOD.pdf

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
Good Day Sir/Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter and client’s claim. 
  
Our LOD as per below: 

Cost of Repair S$ 7,692.13 (Inclusive GST) 

Loss of Rental S$     392.40 ( 3 days) 

GIA Fee S$         2.18 

TOTAL S$ 8,086.71 

  
Kindly confirm the acceptance. 
 
Thanks & Regards 
 
Shinah   
Admin Assistant  
Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
25 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159097 
DID: +65 6703 8163 
Email: seloshinah@motorimage.net 
Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.subaru.asia 
 

To help 
protect your 
privacy, 
Micro so ft 
Office 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet.

To help 
protect your 
privacy, 
Micro so ft 
Office 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet.

To help 
protect your 
privacy, 
Micro so ft 
Office 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 
this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet. 

 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee you may not copy, forward, disclose or 
use any part of this message. If you have received this message in error, please delete it and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. Internet communications cannot be guaranteed to be timely, secure, error-free or virus-free. The 
sender does not accept liability for any errors or omissions.  





 

 

MS First Capital Insurance Limited 
www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 
(UEN 195000106C GST Reg. No. M2-0001676-9) 

 

6 Raffles Quay, #21-00 Singapore 048580| Tel: (65) 6359 1700 Fax: (65) 6222 3547 
Claims & Motor Underwriting Dept. 
16 Raffles Quay, #42-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 Tel: (65) 6359 1800 Fax: (65) 6223 0541 

 

DISCHARGE RECEIPT 

 

 
CLAIM REFERENCE :   D24005504MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 
 
ACCIDENT DATE  :   21/06/2024 
 
ACCIDENT LOCATION :  WOODLANDS DRIVE 44 
 
INSURED  :   COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD 
 
INSURED DRIVER :   TOH YEO CHAI 
 
INSURED VEHICLE :   SHD4401J 
 
INVOLVED PARTY :   SNG8913K 
 
SETTLEMENT SUM :   $8,086.71 

 

I/We, the undernoted CLAIMANT being the person/entity entitled to receive the compensation in relation to the 
accident, hereby agree to accept the SETTLEMENT SUM as full and final settlement of all claims for damages, 
costs & disbursements arising out of the ACCIDENT, and I/WE also agree that the said settlement sum: 
 

 
1. is paid without admission of liability on the part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its 

INSURED and/or its INSURED DRIVER in respect of the said loss and for damage whether now or 
hereafter to become manifest, 

 
2. is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said MS First Capital Insurance Limited and /or its INSURED 

and/or its INSURED DRIVER be absolutely and finally discharged from all claims whatsoever which 
I/WE now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or traceable to the said accident. 

 
 
I/WE acknowledge that this DISCHARGE RECEIPT is not to be construed as an admission of liability on the 
part of MS First Capital Insurance Limited and/or its INSURED and /or its INSURED DRIVER and it shall not be 
used as evidence in any claims or actions which may be made against them or any of them. 
 

 

CLAIMANT:         Signature and Date : 

 

 

WITNESS :          Signature and Date : 

 

 

10th Oct 2024

RAMESH S/O DORASAMY

DENNIS LEONG JIA HUI

29 Nov 24 / Friday















1

Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Seloshinah Sinivasagam <seloshinah@motorimage.net>
Sent: Tuesday, 3 December 2024 9:37 AM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: LKINSTEAM
Subject: Re: OFFER - OUR REF: SNG8913K YOUR REF: SHD4401J DOA: 21 JUN 2024 ***LKK 

Ref: CD/FCI24060276/Rma3
Attachments: SNG8913K DV (3).pdf

Dear Daphne, 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Thanks for the offer, attached you the signed DV for the payment process. 
 
Bank A/C Payee Name : Motor Image Enterprises Pte Ltd 
Bank Acct no : 901-355-461-3 
Payee Bank Name : UOB 
Bank Code : 7375 
Branch Code : 001 
Swift Code : UOVBSGSG 
Payee Email : yeo_boon_siong@tanchong.com 
 
Kindly update our accounts Dept. once the payment is done. 
 
Appreciate you can process payment as soonest. 
 
Regards, 
 
Shinah 
Motor Claims Department - Admin  
 
MOTOR IMAGE ENTERPRISES PTE LTD 
25 Leng Kee Road, Singapore 159097 
DID: +65 6703 8104 
Email: seloshinah@motorimage.net 
Website: www.tanchong.com :: www.subaru.asia 

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, October 8, 2024 12:48 PM 
To: Seloshinah Sinivasagam <seloshinah@motorimage.net> 
Cc: LKINSTEAM <LKINSTEAM@tanchong.org> 
Subject: RE: OFFER - OUR REF: SNG8913K YOUR REF: SHD4401J DOA: 21 JUN 2024 ***LKK Ref: 
CD/FCI24060276/Rma3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 4 October 2024 7:55 PM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: MSFC Ref : D24005504MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // YOUR REF: SHD4401J - OUR REF: 

SNG8913K - TP CLAIM *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24060276/Rma3

Dear Daphne, 
 
As offer as per below: 
 
COR - $7,692.13 
LOR - $359.70 to $392.40 ($119.90 to $130.80  x 3 days) 
GIA Search Fee - $2.18 
Total - $8,054.01 to $8,086.71 
 
Thank you. 
 
Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd  
16 Raffles Quay 
#42-01 Hong Leong Building 
Singapore 048581 
 
D: 6359 1813 | M: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 
Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg 

 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.  
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
  
Confidentiality Notice:  
This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. 
If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If 
you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the 
sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, September 25, 2024 4:58 PM 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MSFC Ref : D24005504MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // YOUR REF: SHD4401J - OUR REF: SNG8913K - TP CLAIM *** 
LKK REF: CD/FCI24060276/Rma3 
 

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, 
opening attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.  

 
Dear Chris, 
 
Your Ref: D24005504MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 
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We refer to the above matter and your email below. 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNG 8913K AND SHD 4401J ON 21/06/2024 
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 25/06/2024 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, MS First Capital Limited. 
 
It is an accident under BOLA:9. OID moving into main road hit onto TP while making right turn into minor road. 
 
Basing on the report of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer MOTOR IMAGE ENTERPRISE PTE LTD is as follows: - 
  

Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair $ 10,177.00 $ 7,692.13 (P/P) (w/GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (3 days x $130.80) (w/GST) $ 392.40 $ 392.40 (3 days x $130.80) (w/GST) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 2.18 $ 2.18 
Total $ 10,571.58 $ 8,086.71 

 
*4 days recommendation for repair. 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 27/06/2024 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
The above is for your approval please. 
 
Thank You  
 
 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 28 June 2024 10:21 AM 
To: Chris Lim Gan Koon <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg> 
Cc: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: MSFC Ref : D24005504MFCT/CTPL/TPD-2 // YOUR REF: SHD4401J - OUR REF: SNG8913K - TP CLAIM *** 
LKK REF: CD/FCI24060276/Rma3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
• TP estimated cost of repair 
• Preliminary advice 
• Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition 
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