Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 December 2024 5:55 PM

To: Soo Leong Keat

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FINALIZE: TP CLAIMS - SLJ2465) & CB6832E ON 08/11/24
Hi Junior,

As per our message,

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair L/S $3,500.00 /- with 05 days of repair before GST, subject to their
approval.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

iy Save the Larth- FPrint only when necessary-

From: Soo Leong Keat <leongkeat.soo@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 5 December 2024 4:37 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: enny@mova.com.sg <enny@mova.com.sg>; 'Jia Yu' <jiayu@mova.com.sg>
Subject: FINALIZE: TP CLAIMS - SLJ2465) & CB6832E ON 08/11/24

Dear Surveyor Rasul,
Please find attached finalize report & after paint photos for your confirmation.
We would like to close at L/S $5,500.00 before GST with 5 repair days.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Junor
Estimator



Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp: 8123 1018
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314
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