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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 1 July 2024 2:26 PM
To: CHARMAINE KONG
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: TP PRI - SMA880S | GBL9614H | DoA 24/06/2024 *** LKK REF: 

CD/LPC24060274/Apa3
Attachments: Preliminary Advice.pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  
•             TP estimated cost of repair 
•             Preliminary advice 
 
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our 
necessary action. 
 
Please note that our officer in charge is Hsiao Tong. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 11:02 AM 
To: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG 
<mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: TP PRI - SMA880S | GBL9614H | DoA 24/06/2024 
 
Dear Charmaine, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 10:12 AM 
To: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; WEI NI TAN <wynni@successunited.com.sg> 
Subject: FW: TP PRI - SMA880S | GBL9614H | DoA 24/06/2024 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs , 
 
Our insured has not filed the report. 
 
We will be appointing LKK for the survey. 
 
Aside to LKK Rajes, FYNA please. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Charmaine Kong 
Claims Officer  | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.268 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Elise Law <eliselaw@successunited.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 9:44 AM 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Cc: WEI NI TAN <wynni@successunited.com.sg> 
Subject: TP PRI - SMA880S | GBL9614H | DoA 24/06/2024  
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Hi, 

 

Kindly arrange TP PRI for our client's vehicle no. SMA880S which was damaged due to the accident. 

 

Attached herein the necessary document for your reference. 

 

Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Elise Law 
Claim Executive 
 
SUCCESS UNITED PTE LTD 
2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2  
#01-33 Kaki Bukit AutoHub 
Singapore 417921 
Tel: 6746 1515      Fax: 6748 5015 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 


