Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 15 May 2025 9:19 AM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)

Cc: Admin A; Yan (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM AGAINST AIG- YP6886R, doa 11.11.24 (AIG insured SDT8989S) *** LKK

REF: CD/AIG24110253/Xua3

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Due By: Thursday, 22 May 2025 4:00 PM
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Please advise whether your client still want to persuade tp claim. If so, please arrange for survey.

We will treat as you are no longer interested in pursuing this third-party claim against us if there is no
reply from you by 21.05.2025.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2024 10:02 AM

To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>; Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM AGAINST AIG- YP6886R, doa 11.11.24 (AIG insured SDT8989S) *** LKK REF:
CD/AIG24110253/Xua3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.
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Please arrange for survey.
Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Yan.
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2024 10:30 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: TP CLAIM AGAINST AIG- YP6886R, doa 11.11.24 (AlG insured SDT8989S)




Dear Sir/ Madam.

OUR CLIENT - YP6886R

DOA - 11/11/24@1400hrs
AIG INSURED - SDT8989S

Attached our client report.

1) PIs forward a copy of the report & sketch plan of GBK4873P if you have it;
2) Pls advise who is the claim handler of this case?

Thank you.

Rgds

June

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Tel : 67556142

Fax : 67557719

Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg




