Rajes (LKK Auto)

From: Rajes (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, March 17, 2025 5:27 PM

To: Chen How Ng; Claims; Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; assignments; Rick Teo
Subject: RE: Status of survey report || Claim ref: C10032773/CH || Ol- SKE543T (Black) TP-

SKA707J || Est: $0.00 || UNIMOTOR COMPANY

Dear Chen How,

Please be informed that owner withdraw the claim from the workshop.

No survey was done for this vehicle.

We will close this file without billing.

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng Chen How <chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 10 March 2025 9:26 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Status of survey report | | Claim ref: C10032773/CH || OI- SKE543T (Black) TP-SKA707J | | Est: $0.00 | |
UNIMOTOR COMPANY

Dear Shiau Chan,

Please forward the survey report and bill when ready.
Thank you.

Best Regards

Ng Chen How
Senior Executive, Claims

T 6047 2134
E chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose

Budget ,
- Direct i
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Customer Care 6221 2111
Claims Hotline (24 Hours) 6221 2199



Claims Hotline (if calling from overseas) +65 6047 2129

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 12 November 2024 9:58 am

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Ng Chen How <chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.qg@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth
Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Rick Teo <rick.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPPD PRS: Claim ref: C10032773/CH | | Ol- SKE543T (Black) TP-SKA707J | | Est: $0.00 | | UNIMOTOR
COMPANY

Dear Boon Chin,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Please be informed that Ms. Shiau Chan is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 6256 3561/

siewsc@Ilkkauto.com

Best Regards,
Rajes | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, November 11, 2024 4:31 PM

To: admin-d <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assighnments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Ng Chen How <chenhow.ng@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Derrick Quok <derrick.g@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Kenneth
Lim <kenneth.lim@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Rick Teo <rick.teo@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Claims
<claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD PRS: Claim ref: C10032773/CH | | OlI- SKE543T (Black) TP-SKA707J | | Est: $S0.00 | | UNIMOTOR
COMPANY

Hi Team,
We would like to request TPPD PRS for SKA707)J. TP chose LKK to survey the vehicle.

Workshop information:
Address:



Workshop z UNMIMOTOR COMPANY
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue &
#01-94

Singapore 417883

Mr Alvin (97981616)

Please confirm assignment.
Thank you.
Warmest Regards,

Lan Boon Chin
Executive, Claims Administration

T 60472144

It pays to choose

Budge't Platinum Trusted
Direct Service Award
insurance feefo

Customer Care 6221 2111
Claims Hotline (24hours) 6221 2199
Claims Hotline (If calling from overseas) +65 60472129

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore 239924
budgetdirect.com.sg

auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to
others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Jacqui Wong <jacquiwong@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2024 2:45 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'Jennifer Guay' <jenniferguay@visionlawllc.com>

Cc: unimotorco@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: PRS Request on 11.11.2024 || C10032773/CH || RE: OUR REF: AW1-jgv-ins-U4-123337-2024(jw) YOUR
REF: SKE543T

Dear Sirs,

PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

CLAIMANT: KENNY AU KAH HON

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA 707 J & SKE 543 T ON 7" NOVEMBER 2024 AT ALONG EAST COAST ROAD
AT ABOUT 16:10 HOURS



We refer to the above matter.

We confirmed that both parties are agreeable to appoint LKK as the Single Joint Expert for the Survey of our
client’s vehicle no. SKA 707 J.

You can inspect our client’s vehicle as follows: -

Workshop : UNIMOTOR COMPANY
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#01-94
Singapore 417883

For Surveyor
Tel : Mr Alvin (97981616)

Please initial here after completion of pre-repair survey.
Please let us hear from you shortly. Thank you.
Thank you. Appointed Surveyor:

Name & Signature
Jacqui Wong (JW) Contact:
(Secretary to Ms Audrey Wong)

Date &Time
VISION LAW LLC
133 New Bridge Road
#25-03/04/05
Chinatown Point Surveyor during repair:
Singapore 059413
Tel: 65342813 [Ext 111] Date &Time:
From: Jacqui Wong <jacquiwong@visionlawllc.com>
Sent: Monday, 11 November 2024 11:37 am Surveyor after repair:
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'Jennifer Guay' <jenn
Cc: unimotorco@singnet.com.sg Date &Time:

Subject: RE: OUR REF: AW1-jgv-ins-U4-123337-2024(jw) YOUR REF: SKE543T

Dear Boon Chin,

PRE-REPAIR SURVEY

CLAIMANT: KENNY AU KAH HON

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA 707 J & SKE 543 T ON 7" NOVEMBER 2024 AT ALONG EAST COAST ROAD
AT ABOUT 16:10 HOURS

We refer to your email of even date.
As requested, we enclose herewith our Client's Police Report.

Please let us have the list as well as your insured’s GIA Report.

Thank you.

Jacqui Wong (JW)
(Secretary to Ms Audrey Wong)

VISION LAW LLC
133 New Bridge Road
#25-03/04/05
Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413



Tel: 65342813 [Ext 111]

From: Claims [mailto:claims@budgetdirect.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 11 November, 2024 11:25 AM

To: Jacqui Wong <jacquiwong@visionlawllc.com>; 'Jennifer Guay' <jenniferguay@visionlawllc.com>
Cc: unimotorco@singnet.com.sg; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: AW1-jgv-ins-U4-SKA707J-2024(jw) YOUR REF: SKE543T

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your email on even date.

Please let us have your client’s GIA report as our insured has yet to make the accident reporting.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Lan Boon Chin
Executive, Claims Administration

T 60472144
It pays to choose
B“dgﬂt Platinum Trusted
Direct " Service Award
insurance | #& 2o tealo

Customer Care 6221 2111
Claims Hotline (24hours) 6221 2199
Claims Hotline (If calling from overseas) +65 60472129

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore 239924
budgetdirect.com.sg

auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct Insurance.

Please note: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential and / or
privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication to
others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies of it. Thank you.

Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Jacqui Wong <jacquiwong@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2024 3:52 pm

To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Frauleine Khoo <frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'Jennifer Guay'
<jenniferguay@visionlawllc.com>




Cc: unimotorco@singnet.com.sg

Subject: RE: OUR REF: AW1-jgv-ins-U4-SKA707J-2024(jw) YOUR REF: SKE543T

AUTO & GENERAL INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Attention: Motor Claim Department

Dear Sirs,

PRE-REPAIR SURVEY
CLAIMANT: KENNY AU KAH HON

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKA 707 J & SKE 543 T ON 7" NOVEMBER 2024 AT ALONG EAST COAST ROAD

AT ABOUT 16:10 HOURS

We are instructed by KENNY AU KAH HON to notify you of a road accident on 7" NOVEMBER 2024 AT ALONG
EAST COAST ROAD AT ABOUT 16:10 HOURS involving our client's SKA 707 J & SKE 543 T driven by your

driver at the material time.

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceed to repair the damaged
vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you or your insurer would
like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not receive any reply from you within the stipulated

timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the vehicle without further reference to you.

Thank you.

Jacqui Wong (JW)
(Secretary to Ms Audrey Wong)

VISION LAW LLC

133 New Bridge Road
#25-03/04/05
Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: 65342813 [Ext 111]

For Surveyor
Please initial here after completion of pre-repair survey.

Thank you.

Appointed Surveyor:
Name & Signature

Contact:

Date & Time

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)
Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #25-03/0

Surveyor during repair:

Date &Time:

Surveyor after repair:

Date &Time:

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only

intended for the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the senderimmediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading,

storing and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of

any errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email
transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.




VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #25-03/04/05 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only
intended for the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading,
storing and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of
any errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #25-03/04/05 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only
intended for the recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the senderimmediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading,
storing and/or disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of
any errors or omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.




