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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2024 10:04 AM

To: Ho Yue Meng

Cc: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Accident Involving GBG6632B and SHD6042Z on 11/11/2024

Hi Ho, 

 

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $3,436.80 /- with 04 days of repair before GST, subject to 

their approval. 

 

 

 
Best Regards,  

Rasul | Assessor  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

The linked image cannot be displayed.  The file may have been moved, renamed, or deleted. Verify that the link points to the correct  
file and location.
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From: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com> 

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2024 3:16 pm 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBG6632B and SHD6042Z on 11/11/2024  

  
Dear Sir, 
  
Please find attached photos before paint for GBG6632B 

  
Also, please find attached finalized bill for GBG6632B. 
  
Total Repair Days :  4 Days 

  
Thank-you. 

  
  
  
Best Regards 

YM Ho 

TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd 

No 1, Sixth Lok Yang Road 

Singapore 628099 

DID: 67038432 

  

From: Ho Yue Meng  

Sent: Friday, 15 November 2024 9:38 am 
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To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBG6632B and SHD6042Z on 11/11/2024 

Importance: High 

  

Dear Sir, 
  
Kindly arrange for survey of GBG6632B (3rd Party Direct Settlement) 
on 18/11/2024 (Monday) between 9.00 am and 10.00 am at our workshop at Lok Yang. 
  
Thank-you. 
  
  
Best Regards 

YM Ho 

TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd 

No 1, Sixth Lok Yang Road 

Singapore 628099 

DID: 67038432 

  

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2024 4:10 pm 

To: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving GBG6632B and SHD6042Z on 11/11/2024 

  

Dear Ho, 

  

GBG6632B Kindly arrange survey and let us know date and time in advance. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rajes | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

 

 You don't often get email from rajes@lkkauto.com. Learn why this is important   


