Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Rachel Wu <RachelWu@misfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 June 2025 3:23 PM

To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto); Admin A; SUR; Eunice Chin Mei Yee

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - OUR REF: D24008955MFCT *** LKK REF:
CD/FCI24110147/Tma3

Dear LKK,

Please advise update on the survey report and Invoice.

Kindly note that the officer in-charge is Eunice.

Dear Eunice,

For your follow up.

Thank you

Best Regards

Rachel Wu

Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building| Singapore 048581

D: 6359 1812] Tel: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 | Reg. No. 195000106C Website http://www,msfirstcapital.com.sg

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-
mail.

————— Original Message-----

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 13 February 2025 3:44 pm

To: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - OUR REF: D24008955MFCT *** LKK REF: CD/FCI24110147/Tma3

Hi Emily,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP estimated cost of repair
Preliminary advice
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition
Thank you.
Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin



Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKkwan@Ilkkauto.com Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2024 3:39 PM

To: Caroline Cabrera <Caroline@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - OUR REF: D24008955MFCT

Dear Caroline,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Rajes | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

————— Original Message-----

From: Caroline Cabrera <Caroline@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 5:40 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Emily Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@ msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Lim Teng Keat <tengkeat.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Emily
Tan Su Min <EmilyTan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Vikneswaran Naidu
Ayavoo <vikneswarannaidu.ayavoo@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit
<kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: NEW SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - OUR REF: D24008955MFCT

Dear Sir,

Please find the attached documents for survey assignment.
Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline Cabrera

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building|Singapore 048581
D: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 | Reg. No. 195000106C Website http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.



Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the
sender immediately by return e-mail.

————— Original Message-----

From: support@msfirstcapital.com.sg <support@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 5:03 PM

To: Caroline Cabrera <Caroline@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: MT00018470 is Approved

Insured Vehicle No : SHD4754R

TP Vehicle No  :SLF145S

Claim No : D24008955MFCT

Workshop Name  : CYCLE & CARRIAGE FRANCE PTE LIMITED
Our Surveyor : LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Instructions : Direct Settlement

(SUBJECTED TO QUANTUM TO BE AGREED)

Created By : CAROLINE

Verified By : EMILYTAN
Approved By : EMILYTAN

This is a computer generated mail. Do not reply to this mail.



