Claimant Ref: MC1904407 (SLWS727X)
10D No: CY24/MID20364/260624/0023

1/ We, the undersigned WONG CHONG MENG DO HEREBY AGREL that payment by the

Government of the Republic of Singapore as represented by the Ministry of Defence

(heremafter referred to as the “Government™) of the sum of SGD TWO THOUSAND FOUR
HUNDRED SIXTY TV 3$2,462.00) shall be the full and final settlement of all

claims (other than Personal Injury Claims) howsoever arising out of or in connection with the

damages caused o my/our vehicle no. SLW8727X in an accident involving Government

vehicle no. MID20364 on 26/06/2024 at/ along SLE TOWARDS TPE,

I/ We hereby authorize you to make payment in favour of AH_LIM _MOTOR
COMPANY.

/' We agree that the payment is made without any admission of liability on the part of the
Government or any agent or servant of the Government, I/We declare that [/We have no further
claim whatsoever against the Government or any agent or servant of the Government in respect
of the abovementioned incident and hereby give the Government a full and final discharge in
respect of any liability or liabilities (Excluding Personal Injury Claims) which may arise out
of the aforesaid accident,

1/We also declare that 1 am/We are the person entitled to receive the above compensation and
hereby undertake to indemnify the Government against any claim made or which may be made

by any person in connection with this matter.

Date: 7;/) ( Q] I (IZV', A‘j JX/

o

Signature of Claimant (with company stamp if applicable): ¥ f x
Name of Claimant: Wong Chong Meng \

If the Claimant is a Company or Firm, Name and Designation

Of the person signing on behalf of the Company or Firm.

Signature of Witness:

/
z
’ : ; /
Name and Designation of Witness:___ AH LIM ,mﬁ’%mmm
No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Indu T
#01-05 AMK Autopoint
Tel 6483 1244 Fax




Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: CHAN BO WEN, MARCUS (MINDEF) <Chan_Bo_Wen_Marcus@defence.gov.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2024 3:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF); TEY WEI KUAN (MINDEF); AURE ANBROSE ARDRI
TAPALLA (MINDEF)

Subject: Re: [SEEK MANDATE] I0OD: CY24/MID20364/260624/0023 // LKK ref :
CD/MIDA24060258/Kp [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID20364 AND SLW8727X ON
26/06/2024]

Message Classification: Official (Closed)
Hi Ms Chew,

Please proceed to negotiate and settle with civilian repairer.
Regards,
Marcus Chan

Hd TA Invesn & Edu

Sent from Outlook for Android

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, September 24, 2024 2:35:41 PM

To: CHAN BO WEN, MARCUS (MINDEF) <Chan_Bo_Wen_Marcus@defence.gov.sg>

Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF) <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; TEY WEI KUAN (MINDEF)
<Tey_Wei_Kuan@defence.gov.sg>; AURE ANBROSE ARDRI TAPALLA (MINDEF)
<Aure_Anbrose_Ardri_Tapalla@defence.gov.sg>

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] 10D: CY24/MID20364/260624/0023 // LKK ref : CD/MIDA24060258/Kp [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING MID20364 AND SLW8727X ON 26/06/2024]

Message Classification: Official (Closed)
I0D: CY24/MID20364/260624/0023
LKK ref : CD/MIDA24060258/Kpp

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID20364 AND SLW8727X ON 26/06/2024

We refer to the above matter.

We are of the view that SAF driver is at fault as he changed lane and collided with civilian who was driving straight
within his lane.

We would like to seek your approval to negotiate and settle with civilian repairer, M/s AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY.

The summary is as follows: -

Pre-Repair Estimated Mandate Amount

Amount (by workshop)
1. Cost of Repair (with GST) S 5,794.11 $1,962.00 ($1,800.00 + 9%GST)
2. Loss of Rental/Use (5days x $120.00) | $ 500.00 S 500.00 (5days x $100.00)




Total | $6,294.11 | $2,462.00

Enclosed herewith : -

e Repair Estimate — SLW8727X.
e LKK Survey Report & Photos — SLW8727X.
e SAF Report & Photos — MID20364.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: AURE ANBROSE ARDRI TAPALLA (MINDEF) <Aure_Anbrose_Ardri_Tapalla@defence.gov.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2024 10:55 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CHAN BO WEN, MARCUS (MINDEF) <Chan_Bo_Wen_Marcus@defence.gov.sg>; HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF)
<HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; TEY WEI KUAN (MINDEF) <Tey_Wei_Kuan@defence.gov.sg>

Subject: Re: 0D for MID20364

Message Classification: Official (Closed)
Hi Hsiao Tong,

Attached is MID20364 Case File for your further action.

Thank you,
Best Regards
Aure Anbrose

Sent from Outlook for Android

From: AURE ANBROSE ARDRI TAPALLA (MINDEF)

Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2024 11:42:34 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CHAN BO WEN, MARCUS (MINDEF) <Chan Bo Wen Marcus@defence.gov.sg>; HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF)
<HO Aik Seng Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; TEY WEI KUAN (MINDEF) <Tey Wei Kuan@defence.gov.sg>

Subject: RE: IOD for MID20364

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Attached is the MID20364 Case File for your further action.

Thank you,
Best Regards,
Aure Anbrose



From: AURE ANBROSE ARDRI TAPALLA (MINDEF)

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2024 1:29 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: CHAN BO WEN, MARCUS (MINDEF) <Chan Bo Wen Marcus@defence.gov.sg>; HO AIK SENG, DENNIS (MINDEF)
<HO Aik Seng Dennis@defence.gov.sg>; TEY WEI KUAN (MINDEF) <Tey Wei Kuan@defence.gov.sg>

Subject: 10D for MID20364

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Attached is the 10D for MID20364 for your further action.

Thank you,
Best Regards,
Aure Anbrose

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy,
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately
if you receive this in error."

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy,
distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any
information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately
if you receive this in error."



AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

No. 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind, Park 2A #01-09 AMK Autopoint Singapore 568047
TEL: 6483 1244 ( 4 lines ) FAX: 6483 6170 Email: alilimme(@singnet.com.sg
GST:M9-0009639-E RCR NO:06470300B

Our Ref : MC1904407
Your Ref : 20364MID
Date : 04/09/2024

MINISTRY OF DEFENCE

Dear Sir/Madam,

Request for Direct Seitlement for Accident involving our client’s vehicle SLW8727X and your
Insured 20364MID ON 26/06/2024 10:05 ALONG SLE TWDS TPE

We refer to the above matter.

Please assess through your Insured’'s (20364MID) report and our Client (SLW8727X) — WONG
CHONG MENG’s report as attached and advise whether there are possibilities of direct settlement.

Piease find attached the following :

1}  Final Bill

2)  GIA Motor Accident Report form
3}  Certificate of insurance

4}  Rental invoice

The above vehicle was surveyed by Kenneth from LKK as appointed by MINDEF on 22/07/2027.
We would quantify our claim as below:-

Cost of Repair : $1,962.00
Rental invoice : $500.00(5 Day X $100) Suf-yeyor recommend 5 days

Total - $2,462.00

___________________ 1

Kindly acknowledge and revert on the possibiliiy of direct settlement within 14 days.

Thank You.

Yours faithfully,

EE T E o
[ A

Kee Mui Hong



Authorization to Act

Wong Chong Meng (the third party clamant] of
36 Marsiing drive S05-411 Smgapore | J00s6 {acddress), owner of SLWET27X

(Vehicle No) hereby authorize Ah Lim Motor Company (the workshop) to act for me in respect
to mv claim for the repair cost and / or rental and [/ or loss of use (Claim) for my vehicle no

SLWEATITX that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on
2E082024 (date) aleng _SLE lowards TPE {location)
involving the vehicle no _ 20354MID (the accident).

| further authorize the workshop to settle the above-mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive the payment further to settlement

of my claim with payment cheque/s made in favour of the workshop.

| further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/fowner/insurers
of the cther vehicle is concerned.

Dated this _ 220" dayof __ JUMe  (oanth) 20 24 [year)
U\(X(}C AH LM PANY

Signed by Third party clai Signed by the workshop. -« 2o

Owner wehicle no: W BAR) LIAS. Tl AL 1P

Personal Data Protection Act 2012

ffW!aﬂ;mwlgﬂ#

/ or processing my/c

insurance / claim r




AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

No. 16 Ang Me Kio Ind. Park 2A #01-09 AMK Autopoint Singapore 568047
TEL: 6483 1244 { 4 lines ) FAX: 6483 6170 Email: ahlimme@singnet.com sg
GST:M9-0009639-E RCB NO:064703008

M/S:  WONG CHONG MENG
36 MARSILING DRIVE
#05-411
SINGAPORE 730036

TEL: 96748096

ATTN:

Your Ref No: SLW8727X
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  26/06/2024
TP Veh Reg No: 20364MID

Final No: AL1916283
Claim No: MC1904407
Date: 04 Sep 2024
Policy No: P10856574R0]

Veh Reg No: SLW8727X
Make/Model: MITSUBISHI

ATTRAGE 1.2CVT
Chassis No: MMBSTAI3AIH001841

TP Ins Co: MINDEF

Tax Invoice-Final Repair Cost to Vehicle No :SLW8727X

Description '

|  Quantity | List Price
S8

As agreed to proceed repair at Lump Sum Repair

Add GST @ 9%
Total Amount payable

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR ONE THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED SIXTY TWO ONLY
The above vehicle was surveyed by KENNETH KONG -LKK on 22/07/2027

E.&O.E.

For AH LIM MOTOR COMPANY

AUTHORISED SIGR A

PAGE:]
An_ao_unt
53

S$ 1,800.00
162.00
5% 1,962.00



Ace Auto

18, Ubi Road 4 #02-05 Ubi Car Mall
Singapore 408616 Reg no : 53029719A

To: Ah Lim Motor Company Invoice No : As352
10, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2A
#01-09 AMK Autopoint Date 27/7/2024

Singapore 568047

Vehicle No : SLX5160U

Make / Model :  Toyota Vios

Rent to: Ho Zhao Yong - SLW8727X
Account : Ah Lim Motor Company
Rental Ref ; 5352
Days Rate Total
Duration : From:22/07/2024 12.10pm 5 $ 100.00 | $ 500.00
TO : 27/07/2024 13.10pm
Grand Total $ 500.00

for Ace Auto



CE Aut

18 Uni Road 4, #02-07, Singapore 408616
Tel: 6483 6143 Fax: 6483 6170

Renistration No. 53029718 A

RENTAL AGREEME’NT;L.%WCSE@;TE o

Hirar's Name

Date of Birth

R e

A [ Passport / Nric Mo, Mationality
IhAe e
Addrass Qacupation Diiving Lizence Mo, Date of Licance Oblained
Postal Gods Comact Mo | Mobile Piiana He, Ly Vsiiohs Mo,
A EAEET Shoen & TO7
Driver Name Date of Birth Pasgport / Hric No. Mationality
Address Qecupation Driving Licence Mo Date of Lizence Obizined
Postal Codse Conlact No Mobile Phong Mo, 14 A A
! ;""""[ /r /it /: [ )
2 .
Date 7 V /, ’ Time | 7} PRI 4 i
CHECK OUT 227 ' Mease ogd ST T T,
! f KAl i /
Daia Timz Milzacgs . / R |
CHECK IN P ’(j_} ]th o ED’S‘E M| & 114 12 374 B
z \ . lu F*A”i PaAY e T2 vy quaddar tank pates! i G petintis
I35 than tho chscl out amnent,
Ry SV / -
VEHICLE NO. </t %if7 U MODEL 7o sle o
|
IMPORTANT NOTES:- UNIT RATE (§) TOTAL ()
+ This vahicle is restricted to SINGAPORE use only.
oSt 4 RATE PER DAY @
+ BEWARNED: Hirer/ Driver shafl be {Ully responsible for all consequences including
all eulstanding summons and all costs incurred 1o & by the ovmer for any invalid RATE PER WEEK @
entry in Malaysia. -
+ Norefund will be given {or vehicle that returns early RATE PER MONTH o
+ The hirer shal be itable o pay he first .. e B30 dAMAGE 0 vehicle
plus loss of earnings white damaged vehicle is under repair GRAND TOTAL
+ Third Parly Liability is ..o B0 @cCident DEPOSIT
» Hirer shall pay all parking fines & Waffic summans, incurad during the pericd of o
rental. . EXTENSION _  DAYS
. gggx‘fﬁionl‘ One day's advance notice 1s required othervize NA extension will be TOTAL PAYABLE AMOUNT
+ Vehicle should be retumned at the same time as collection except on Saturday
.. whora return time is bafore 10am.
- Velicle rewmned after office hour will e climeged 1o the next working day
+ Hourly extension:- Refer to prevailing rates " DEFPOSIT REFUNDARBLE 88
+ Piease check water & engine oil dally as praventive maintenance
CHANGED OVER FROM VEH, DATE

}
7

- ——=
Hirer's Signature =

)

4

1/Wa have read and agrae fo the terms and conditions of the rental agreement above and as set overfeaf
W deciare that all information given on this form is true and accurate.

Driver Signature

- for ACE Auio

Wiite - Gustomer  Pinie - Account

Blua - File






> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Wehicle to be Exported:
intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No,:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Singapore NRIC
452C

SLWB727X

No

26 Jun 2024
MITSUBISHI
ATTRAGE 1.2 CVT
Grey

2018
3A92UGS3649
MMBSTA13AJH001841
59.0 kW (79 bhp)
$13,760.00

07 Mar 2018

07 Mar 2018

0

$5,000.00

Yes
06 Mar 2028
$3.250.00

06 Mar 2028

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp}
10

$41,400.00

$15,282.00

$18,532.00

You will not be eligible for any COE rebate from the current COE {including unused COE from any lay-up period/s), if you renew your COE.

The information contained herein is correct as at 26 Jun 2024
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