Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: claims@overdriveautosg.com

Sent: Thursday, 14 November 2024 1:40 PM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMX 1164Z - Finalize

Hi Steve,

Thank you for the email,

We confirm $4450.00 (L/S, before GST) with 4 repair days

Kind regards,
Kian

OVERDRIVE AUTO PTE LTD

2 KAKI BUKIT AVE 2 AUTOHUB
#01-26

Hp: 96979666

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2024 3:00 pm

To: claims@overdriveautosg.com

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SMX 1163Z - Finalize

Hi Sir,
Kindly refer our finalize $4450.00 (L/S, before GST). 4 days. (Subject to insurance approval)

Please confirm.

Thanks and regards,
Steve Chen
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6256-3561 | email: stevechen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




