Shagilah (LKK Auto)

From: Shagqilah (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 November 2024 2:55 PM

To: Lim Tien Siong

Cc: Tan Pei Wei; Roger How Keen Meng; Steve Chen (LKK Auto); Accounts (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: <Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd> Hyundai AE loniq - Vehicle No: SH
6389Y (Inv. SAC2401492 )- Evaluation Report

Attachments: SH 6389Y - LKKAdjustment.pdf; SH 6389Y - LKKLetter.pdf

Dear Mr Lim,

As our tele communication earlier..
Enclose herewith the report.

Thank you!

Best Regards,

Shagqilah| Account

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6741-2674 Ext.126 | email: Account@LKKAuto.com | fax: 6844-8805
Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: Shagilah (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 November 2024 2:23 PM

To: Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>; Roger How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
<SteveChen@lkkauto.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd> Hyundai AE loniq - Vehicle No: SH 6389Y ( Inv. SAC2401492 )-
Evaluation Report

Dear Sir/Mdm,

| couldn’t create invoice thru Coupa System.

The report will be email to you once payment has been made.

Kindly refer below for our bank details, please notify us once the payment has done. Thank you!

Name of Bank Account LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Name of Bank UOB Ltd
Bank — Branch No. 7375 -016




Account No. 339-301-993-8

Email address for remittance advice account@lkkauto.com
PAYNOW ID 199607198R002
Swift Code UOVBSGSG

Best Regards,

Shagqilah| Account

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6741-2674 Ext.126 | email: Account@LKKAuto.com | fax: 6844-8805
Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

From: Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 November 2024 2:19 PM

To: Shagilah (LKK Auto) <shagilah@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>; Roger How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
<SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: <Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd> Hyundai AE loniq - Vehicle No: SH 6389Y ( Inv. SAC2401492 )-
Evaluation Report

Hi Shagqilah,

How about the damage revise, LKK's report - yet to receive from your end.
Please expedite.

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Accident Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156
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From: Shagilah (LKK Auto) <shagilah@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 November 2024 1:47 pm

To: Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: Tan Pei Wei <tanpw@cdge.com.sg>; Roger How Keen Meng <rogerhow@cdge.com.sg>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
<SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Accounts (LKK Auto) <account@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: <Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd> Hyundai AE loniq - Vehicle No: SH 6389Y ( Inv. SAC2401492 )-
Evaluation Report




CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open
attachment unless you know the sender.

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Attached herewith our invoice for the above.
Kindly acknowledge receipt by replying to this email.

We will then proceed to submit our survey fees through Coupa System.

Thank you!

Best Regards,

Shaqgilah | Account

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6741-2674 Ext.126 | email: Account@LKKAuto.com | fax: 6844-8805
Blk 51, PayaUbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify
us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents
therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation
Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein
shall constitute a binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a
written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you
to print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]




