Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 17 December 2024 9:16 AM
Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB)

Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Chuan Hao CHAI (CNB); Khairul Azhar ABAS (CNB)
[SEEK MANDATE] - SLL9157S // DOA: 04/11/2024 // LKK REF:
CD/CNB24110096/Upp
SKR 2515T ESTIMATE_MARKED.pdf; SKR2515T LOD.pdf; LKK SURVEY REPORT &
PHOTOS_SKR2515T.pdf

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL9157S(CNB) AND SKR2515T ON 04/11/2024

We refer to the above matter.

It is a head-to-rear collision. Under Motor Accident Guide, CNB driver’s is at fault as he should keep a safety distance
with third party vehicle.

Diagram 1,56

Vehicle X - Travelling
behind Vehicle
Y and colliding
into the rear of

SCENARIO REASON(S) ";E" ";"
% | %
FRONT-TO-REAR COLLISIONS/REVERSING
31.|(a) Reason(s): Driver X|100| 0
travelling behind

Vehicle Y
Vehicle Y — Stationary
travelling
straight ahead in
front of Vehicle

X

Vehicle ¥ must keep a
safe distance.™

Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability.
We seek your approval to offer third party solicitor " FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD" at $4,578.00(all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Pre-Repair Estimated

Amount Claimed (LOD-FALCON-AIR

Mandate Amount

Amount (by AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD)
workshop)
1. Cost of Repair $12,422.17 $4,142.00 (with GST) $4,142.00 ($3,800.00 + 9%GST)
2. Loss of RENTAL S 436.00 (4days x $100.00)(with GST) | S 436.00 (4DAYS X $100.00)(with
Total | $12,422.17 $4,578.00 $4,578.00




Enclosed herewith : -

e Repair Estimate — SKR2515T.
e Third Party LOD — SKR2515T.
e LKK Survey Report & Photos — SKR2515T.

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.

Wonderjul (Clnistmas Fappy Hew Year 2025 |
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2024 3:14 PM

To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>; Chuan Hao CHAI (CNB) <CHAI_Chuan_Hao@cnb.gov.sg>;
Khairul Azhar ABAS (CNB) <Khairul_Azhar_ABAS@cnb.gov.sg>

Subject: RE: Case Assignment - SLL9157S // DOA: 04/11/2024 // LKK REF: CD/CNB24110096/Upp

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLL9157S(CNB) AND SKR2515T ON 04/11/2024

We have conducted inspection for SKR2515T.

Please refer to the attached appraisal of damaged vehicle before repair and photos for your perusal.
Our further advice will follow in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2024 8:25 AM

To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
<bryanang@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Chuan Hao CHAI (CNB) <CHAI Chuan Hao@cnb.gov.sg>; Khairul Azhar ABAS (CNB)




<Khairul Azhar ABAS@cnb.gov.sg>
Subject: RE: Case Assignment - SLL9157S

Dear Sirs,

We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 05/11/2024.
We will handle accordingly.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad Juahir Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2024 6:35 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Chuan Hao CHAI (CNB) <CHAI Chuan Hao@cnb.gov.sg>; Khairul Azhar ABAS (CNB)

<Khairul Azhar ABAS@cnb.gov.sg>

Subject: Case Assignment - SLL9157S

Message Classification: Restricted
Hi Hsiao Tong,
CNB vehicle SLL9157S collided against the rear of member of public vehicle SKR2515T.

Please take up the assignment and follow-up with third party. The vehicle is insured under NTUC Income
Insurance.

Grateful if you can submit the interim update by end next week.

Thank you.

Mohamad Juahir

Logistics Unit

Corporate Services Division
91501422

CNB

For a Drug-Free Singapore

Central Narcotics Bureau Visit us at CNB.GOV.SG | Follow us on 0 Jof
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