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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 5 July 2024 10:25 AM
To: kennychan@alanutd.com
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SLQ8040A (CHINA) OUR CLIENT VEHICLE 

SLL1096L ACCIDENT ON 21-06-2024 *** LKK REF: CD/CTI24060253/Kpa3

Dear Sir / Mdm, 
 
We refer to above matter 
 
Please be informed that our principal M/s CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD had repudiated the claim due 
insured to breach in policy terms & conditions. Please redirect claim to the insured/ insured driver. 
 
Thank you. 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
  
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, July 4, 2024 8:28 AM 
To: kennychan@alanutd.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SLQ8040A (CHINA) OUR CLIENT VEHICLE SLL1096L ACCIDENT ON 
21-06-2024 *** LKK REF: CD/CTI24060253/Kpa3 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We are unable to comment DS as case is under investigation. 
 
 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 3, 2024 5:45 PM 
To: kennychan@alanutd.com; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SLQ8040A (CHINA) OUR CLIENT VEHICLE SLL1096L ACCIDENT ON 
21-06-2024 *** LKK REF: CD/CTI24060253/Kpa3 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
  
Please see attached….. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, July 3, 2024 4:18 PM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SLQ8040A (CHINA) OUR CLIENT VEHICLE SLL1096L ACCIDENT ON 
21-06-2024  
 
Dear Person In-Charge  
 
Please update liability status thank you . 
 
Regards  
Kenny  
Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd  
64538686 
 
 

From: kennychan@alanutd.com [mailto:kennychan@alanutd.com]  
Sent: Monday, July 1, 2024 3:24 PM 
To: 'admin-a@lkkauto.com' <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SLQ8040A (CHINA) OUR CLIENT VEHICLE SLL1096L ACCIDENT ON 21-
06-2024  
 
Dear Person In-Charge  
 
Please check the above t. p. claim your principle insured vehicle SLQ8040A liability for direct settlement ,our client 
vehicle SLL1096L accident on 21-06-2024 ,survey was done on 24-06-2024 by Kenneth thank you . 
 
 
Regards  
Kenny  
Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd  
64538686 
 


