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From: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 August 2025 9:53 AM 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: LOD SUBMISSION: OUR REF: GBE 9539 D ; YOUR REF: YP 5020 D ; DOA: 29/10/2024 
 

Caution: This email is from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments if you do not recognize the sender.  

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Our Ref               : GBE9539D 
Your Ref              : YP5020D 
  
26/08/2025 
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD 
300 Beach Rd #17-04/07 
Singapore 199555 
  
Attention: Motor Claims Department 
  
Dear Sir/Mdm. 
  
Accident on 29/10/2024 along 4 PANDAN CRESCENT, OUTSIDE #04-04 involving vehicles GBE 
9539 D and YP 5020 D 
  
We refer to the above-mentioned accident. 
 
We are claiming as per below: 
  

1. Repair Cost $ 2,616.00 

2. LOR for 8 Days x $150 per day $ 1,200.00 

3. 
      

LTA/GIA Search fee $      27.25 

  TOTAL $ 3,843.25 

  
Enclosed here is a copy of each relevant GIA report, LTA, Proforma Tax invoice, and Letter of 
Authorization for your attention. Kindly let us have your reply within the next 14 days upon receipt 
of this letter. 
  
If you have any enquiries, please contact us @ 80350316 or you may email to us 
at claims@bifrostauto.com 
  
 
Yours faithfully, 
Ryan 
BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD.  
  
NOTE: # Please note that the Loss of Use will be paid based on negotiation and on the NIMA 
Protocol (Court Guideline). 
  



996 BENDEMEER ROAD #03-07 B CENTRAL S ((339944)
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BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD. 
GST. Reg. No. : 201929175W 

6001 Beach Road #22-01, Golden Mile Tower, Singapore 199589     email: claims@bifrostauto.com 

Tax Invoice 
  

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD  
300 Beach Rd #17-04/07 Singapore 199555 

Inv. No. :  
Inv. Date : 

Ref : 
Terms : 

Veh. No. :  
Make & Model : 

BA.RA.2510034 
23-10-2025 
2024-10-29 

30 Days 
GBE 9539 D 

TOYOTA 
HIACE 

 
 

# Description Qty Rate Total Tax 

1 REPAIR COSTS 1.0 $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $216.00 

 
 
 
 

 
Subtotal for invoice : S$2,400.00 

Prevailing GST : S$216.00 

Total : S$2,616.00 

 
 On behalf of BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD. 
  

 
 
 

 (Authorised Signature) 

 
Please make cheque payable to “BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD” and mail to 6001 BEACH ROAD #22-
01, GOLDEN MILE TOWER Singapore 199589 or direct bank transfer to DBS Bank Current 
Account 070-902-886-1. 



GOOD  WAY RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD

Invoice

GBE9539D

NUR IMAN BIN SAMAT

Invoice No

Invoice Date

Due Date

VHA No

Referral ID

: RAGPLIN0000025

: 05/11/2024

: 05/11/2024

: RA0025

: RA

Description : Amount

Rental for 8 Day/s a $150 per Day $ 1,200.00

Vehicle No : GBE8062T

Vehicle Description : Nissan NV350

Rental Period : 29/10/2024 to 05/10/2024

Total Amount Payable: $ 1,200.00

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #06-04 Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875
Tel: 6315 8479 HP: 9833 0807

UEN: 201505120D





Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 30 Oct 2024 / 14:48:24
Receipt Date/Time : 30 Oct 2024 / 14:48:24

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-241030-002203

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.

Amount
Before

GST (S$)

GST
Amount

(S$)

Amount
After GST

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - YP5020D
As at 29 Oct 2024/09:14:00
Insurance Co: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
1 Insurance Enquiry - YP5020D

Enquiry Fee  
20241030144741869092

25.00 2.25 27.25

Sub-Total 25.00 2.25 27.25

Total Before Rounding 25.00 2.25 27.25

Rounding Difference 0.00

Total Amount Payable 27.25
 

Paid By

526471XXXXXX1912 eNETS Credit Card 27.25

Total 27.25

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 27.25

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

 

 

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

 

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.
 

> Back to OneMotoring
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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: JASMINE LOK KHENG KWEI <JASMINELOK@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 October 2025 9:53 AM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: Our ref: 24/24/24/VC05/030107 - OUR REF: GBE 9539 D ; YOUR REF: YP 5020 D ; 

DOA: 29/10/2024 ***LKK Ref: CD/LPC24110090/Ama3q2(N)

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Daphne, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Jasmine Lok 
Claims Department | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 

 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 30 September 2025 10:08 am 
To: JASMINE LOK KHENG KWEI <JASMINELOK@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: Our ref: 24/24/24/VC05/030107 - OUR REF: GBE 9539 D ; YOUR REF: YP 5020 D ; DOA: 29/10/2024 
***LKK Ref: CD/LPC24110090/Ama3q2(N) 
 

Caution: This email is from an external sender. DO NOT click links or open attachments if you do not recognize the sender.  

 
Dear Jasmine, 
 
Your Ref: 24/24/24/VC05/030107 
 
We refer to the above matter and your email below. 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 9539D AND YP 5020D ON 29/10/2024  
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We have highlighted to your good office on 30/10/2024 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
 
It is an accident under BOLA: 22. OID hit onto TP parked vehicle (tailgate opened). 
 
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD is as follows: - 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair $ 6,540.70 $ 2,616.00 (L/S) (w/GST) 
2. Loss of Rental (08 days x $150.00) $ 1,200.00 $    600.00 (05 days x $120.00) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $       27.25 $      27.25 
Total $ 7,767.95 $ 3,243.25 

 
*03 days recommendation for repair. 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 12/09/2025 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
The above is for your approval please. 
 
 
Thank You 
 

For future correspondence, please remove meikwan@lkkauto.com and admin-a@lkkauto.com in your email. Thanks. 

Best Regards, 

Daphne Lee (Ms) | Case Handler 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | Email: DaphneLee@lkkauto.com|  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: JASMINE LOK KHENG KWEI <JASMINELOK@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 1 September 2025 5:39 PM 
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Our ref: 24/24/24/VC05/030107 - LOD SUBMISSION: OUR REF: GBE 9539 D ; YOUR REF: YP 5020 D ; DOA: 
29/10/2024 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Daphne, 
 
Enclosed TPD LOD for your action. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Jasmine Lok 


