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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 12 March 2025 11:15 AM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Cc: ral@bifrostauto.com; SUR

Subject: Re: GBH 6202 D- FINALIZATION ; DOA: 30/10/2024

 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Huey Yon, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

We accept the finalized amount of LS $6100.00 / 7 DAYS of repair for Vehicle number: GBH 6202 D 

 

We will follow up with the LOD shortly. 

 

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit and 

application of this document.  

 

Best Regards, 

Jeza 

Motor Claims Department 

BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD 

 

 

On Tue, 11 Mar 2025 at 14:04, Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
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“Without Prejudice”  

  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $6,100 /- with 7 days of repair, subject to their approval.  

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 7 March 2025 2:30 PM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fwd: GBH 6202 D- FINALIZATION ; DOA: 30/10/2024 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

 Dear Huey Yon,  
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Please facilitate the finalization of Vehicle Number: GBH 6202 D 

 

Your help is highly appreciated. 

  

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit 
and application of this document. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Lewis 

Motor Claims Department 

BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD 

  

---------- Forwarded message --------- 

From: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com> 

Date: Fri, 29 Nov 2024 at 10:27 

Subject: GBH 6202 D- FINALIZATION ; DOA: 30/10/2024 

To: Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <ADRIANLING@lkkauto.com> 

  

 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
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 Dear Adrian,  

  

Please facilitate the finalization of Vehicle Number: GBH 6202 D 

 

Your help is highly appreciated. 

  

The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit 
and application of this document. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Jeza 

Motor Claims Department 

BIFROST AUTO PTE. LTD 

  


