






 

 

  
RELEASE VOUCHER 

(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim) 
 

 
“We/I, SPEEDWERKZ PTE LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm that we/I have reached an 
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO 
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for 
S$5,886.00 (Repair Cost), S$700.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), S$117.25 (Disbursement) for vehicle no. 
GBB 8964G that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 30/10/2024 (date) 
at/along JALAN BUKIT MERAH (location) involving vehicle no/s SNN 5869M. This is pursuant 
to the inspection conducted on 30/10/2024 (date) at “the workshop”. 
 
We/I confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner UNI GREAT CONSTRUCTION PTE 
LTD (the third party claimant”) of vehicle no. GBB 8964G make the claim as set out in the above 
paragraph and we/I have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I 
deem fit. We/I enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”. 
 
We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, 
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party 
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and 
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the 
damage to GBB 8964G (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident. 
 
We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the 
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a 
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.  
 
This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have 
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.  
 
 
Dated this _________ (day) of _____________ (month) 20__ _ (year) 
 
 
 
 
___ ____________________     ______________________________ 
Signed by appointed surveyor     Signed by “the workshop” (with chop) 

26th December 24
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Quah <joykequah@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 13 December 2024 4:06 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNN5869M(AIG) / GBB8964G / 

OTHERS AT/ALONG JALAN BUKIT MERAH NEAR JUNCTION OF COLLEGE ROAD ON 
30/10/2024

Attachments: ADDENDUM FORM_SNN5869M_signed.pdf

Hello Ms Chew, 
 
Thanks for your call earlier and apologies for the inconvenience caused.  
Addendum signed and attached to this email.  
 
Regards, 
Joy 
 
On Fri, Dec 13, 2024 at 3:08 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Ms Joy, 

  

As per our tele-conversation earlier, there were total 4 vehicles involved in the collision. 

  

Please assist to sign on the addendum form attached and return it to us (LKK) via email for our further action. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2024 10:00 AM 
To: 'Joy Quah' <joykequah@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNN5869M(AIG) / GBB8964G / OTHERS AT/ALONG 
JALAN BUKIT MERAH NEAR JUNCTION OF COLLEGE ROAD ON 30/10/2024 

  

Dear Ms Joy, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

We will handle the matter at our end. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Joy Quah <joykequah@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2024 8:52 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: CLAIM NOTIFICATION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNN5869M(AIG) / GBB8964G / OTHERS AT/ALONG 
JALAN BUKIT MERAH NEAR JUNCTION OF COLLEGE ROAD ON 30/10/2024 

  

Dear Sir/Mdm,  
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I do not have further input. I think the report I submitted to AIG, as well as the in-car video footage 
shows the sequence of events very clearly.  Please do not hesitate to contact me at 96442860 if 
there are any issues.  

  

Thank you,  

Joy 

  

On Wed, Nov 6, 2024 at 11:44 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

QUAH LI JUAN, JOY (KE LIJUAN)                                                 [By Email Only] 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

You Ref: SNN5869M 

Our Ref: CD/AIG24110022/Upa3 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNN5869M(AIG) / GBB8964G / OTHERS AT/ALONG JALAN BUKIT MERAH NEAR JUNCTION 
OF COLLEGE ROAD ON 30/10/2024 

  

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 

  

We have received a claim from GBB8964G against your insurance policy. 

  

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information 
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed 
to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 

  

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please 
contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 

  

Thank you.  
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead 

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  



 

Claim Audit

 

  AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
04 Nov
2024
10:22

Clm Dtl Modified Claimant's Name: -> UNI GREAT CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 19970211
8R.

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

2
04 Nov
2024
10:22

Clm Veh Model
Changed (208002) NISSAN CABSTAR 3.0 5 ABS 2DR 2WD 3.4T (M). [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

3
04 Nov
2024
10:22

Clm Created
Reg No: GBB8964G. Acct Date: 2024/10/30. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific In
surance Pte. Ltd. (SG). TP Insurer: Lonpac Insurance Bhd (HQ). Workshop: SPEEDWERK
Z PTE LTD (Autobay) (HQ)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
04 Nov
2024
10:22

Adj Co Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

5
04 Nov
2024
10:22

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2024/11/13 [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
04 Nov
2024
10:22

Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
04 Nov
2024
10:22

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insuran
ce Pte. Ltd. (Express)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
04 Nov
2024
10:22

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
04 Nov
2024
10:23

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
04 Nov
2024
10:23

Adj Adjuster
Assigned [None] -> MARCUS CHUA [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

11
05 Nov
2024
08:48

Adj Im. Advice
Submitted Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2024/11/13 [A] CHEW HSIAO

TONG

12
05 Nov
2024
16:41

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO

TONG

13
05 Nov
2024
16:41

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO

TONG

14
06 Nov
2024
09:14

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO

TONG

15
05 Dec
2024
16:58

Adj Rpt Initiated [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

16
05 Dec
2024
16:58

Ins Email
Updated [None] -> [EMAIL@GMAIL.COM] [A] JOANNE LEE

KHANG MIN

17
05 Dec
2024
16:58

Clm Dtl Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3. [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

18
05 Dec
2024
16:58

Clm Dtl Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2010/07/31. [A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

19
05 Dec
2024
16:58

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE LEE
KHANG MIN

20
13 Dec
2024
14:43

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO

TONG

21
13 Dec
2024
14:43

Video
Downloaded Downloaded Video - Accident [A] CHEW HSIAO

TONG

22
16 Dec
2024
08:14

Adj Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:6803.25:Liability: 100%(BOLA 28) *Quantum: $6,803.25 (all-in). Pls refer to a
djuster report for details. *For your approval please.

[A] CHEW HSIAO
TONG

23
16 Dec
2024
14:54

Adj Next Rpt
Changed Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2024/11/13. Mandate Remarks: Approved, thank you. [I] Ng, Jeffrey-SK

24
16 Dec
2024
14:54

Adj Mandate Set Approved:6803.25:Approved, thank you. [I] Ng, Jeffrey-SK

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go

ACTIVITY
[13/12/2024 14:47] CHEW HSIAO TONG:

12/26/24, 9:58 AM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1486295&extid=467817&CFID=19… 1/2

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=197673&CFTOKEN=7cd1cba4e81a5f6c-01E4B47F-A54A-2154-8713AE8FE53D1211&USID=3251&RID=7282042
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=197673&CFTOKEN=7cd1cba4e81a5f6c-01E4B47F-A54A-2154-8713AE8FE53D1211&USID=3251&RID=7282042
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=197673&CFTOKEN=7cd1cba4e81a5f6c-01E4B47F-A54A-2154-8713AE8FE53D1211&USID=3251&RID=7282042
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=197673&CFTOKEN=7cd1cba4e81a5f6c-01E4B47F-A54A-2154-8713AE8FE53D1211&USID=3251&RID=7282042&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1486295%26extid%3D467817%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=197673&CFTOKEN=7cd1cba4e81a5f6c-01E4B47F-A54A-2154-8713AE8FE53D1211&USID=3251&RID=7282042


CALLED OID, MS JOY. TO CONFIRM TOTAL VEHICLE INVOLVED IN THE ACCIDENT. SHE CONFIRM TOTAL 4 VEHICLES. THE 1ST VEHICLE
INFRONT OF LORRY WAS HER COLLEAGUE, SHE SAID THAT HER COLLEAGUE DROVE OFF EARLY AS THE DAMAGES IS MINOR, STILL THINKING
WHETHER TO REPORT/ CLAIM OR NOT. LATER, 1ST CAR DRIVER DECIDED TO REPORT AND CLAIM.

Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

3266356 05 Nov 2024
08:48:29

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

GBB8964G SNN5869M 12.00

3266856 05 Nov 2024
15:40:19

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

GBB8964G SNN5869M 12.00

12/26/24, 9:58 AM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1486295&extid=467817&CFID=19… 2/2
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