
















 
 
LH CAR RENTAL PTE LTD                                            
DRIVER: LIM BOON HER  
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SLV4773T 
Our Ref: CD/CTI24110020/Uua3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV4773T(CHINA TAIPING) AND SLS58S AT/ ALONG 
CARPENTER STREET ON 30/10/2024 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are 
the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SLS58S against your motor insurance policy. 
  
Based on the accident report and police investigation results on hand, we are of the view that 
liability is not in your driver’s favour. Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable 
settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to 
even more cost. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 
settlement, please contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Thank you. 
 
Yours faithfully, 
 
 
 
Yan 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 6054 
FAX: 6741 4108 
Email: yan@lkkauto.com 
 
 
c.c. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Yan (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Lee (CTPIS) <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Friday, 25 July 2025 4:35 pm
To: Yan (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: CTI REF: SNM24D206157/SLV4773T/C02/LEEPG - LKK REF: 

CD/CTI24110020/Uua3, SLS58S | DOA: 30/10/2024 - TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT

[Confidential] 

 
Hi Yan 
 
Please proceed to resolve the matter up to $ 25,370.75(all-in). 
 
 
 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
Cecilia Lee 
Claims Department  
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized 
disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender 
immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 

From: Cecilia Lee (CTPIS)  
Sent: Wednesday, 19 March 2025 11:53 am 
To: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: CTI REF: SNM24D206157/SLV4773T/C02/LEEPG - LKK REF: CD/CTI24110020/Uua3, SLS58S 
| DOA: 30/10/2024 - TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT 
 
Hi Yan 
 
Please forward us the Rental Agreement and hirer’s IC & driving license. 
 
 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
Cecilia Lee 
Claims Department  
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized 
disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender 
immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 

From: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 19 March 2025 11:37 am 
To: Cecilia Lee (CTPIS) <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] RE: CTI REF: SNM24D206157/SLV4773T/C02/LEEPG - LKK REF: CD/CTI24110020/Uua3, SLS58S | 
DOA: 30/10/2024 - TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT 
 

[Confidential] 

 

 

[Confidential] 

 
 
 
Your ref: SNM24D206157/SLV4773T/C02/LEEPG 
LKK ref : CD/CTI24110020/Uua3 

   

Dear Sirs/Mdm,  

   

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLV4773T(CHINA TAIPING) / SLS58S(TP)/ OTHERS ON 30/10/2024 

   

We refer to the above matter.  

   

We are of the view that liability is not in our driver's favour as he turning from opposite road and collided on third party 
vehicle which moving straight on his lane in his right. 

 

We seek your approval to offer repairer “FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at $ 25,370.75(all-in). 

  

The summary is as follows: - 

  

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair  $47,354.23 $23,980.00 ($22,000.00 + 9%GST) 

2. Loss of Rental (17days x $180.00) $  3,060.00 $   1,200.00 (8days x $150.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA SEARCH FEE $        27.25 $        27.25 
4. Towing Fee $      163.50 $      163.50 

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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Total $50,604.98 $ 25,370.75 

  

Surveyor recommended 6days for repair. 

   

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.  

Kindly note that this inspection report dated 04/03/2025 is only for mandate purpose.  

   

Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.  
 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 
Yan 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Email: yan@lkkauto.com| DID: 6841-6051 | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: Cecilia Lee (CTPIS) <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Monday, November 4, 2024 3:30 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: CTI REF: SNM24D206157/SLV4773T/C02/LEEPG - LKK REF: CD/CTI24110020/Uua3, SLS58S | DOA: 30/10/2024 - 
TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT 
 

[Confidential] 

 
Hi Sir/Madam 
 
Please retrieve SAS from link below for damage consistency check. Please note that the link expires aŌer 7 days. 
 
SNM24D206157 lkk fastech 
 
We have also wriƩen to Insured for Rental Agreement and hirer’s IC & driving license. A copy of email also aƩached for 
your info. Please follow up and check insured driver’s driving license and vocaƟonal license status. 
 
Thanks & Regards 
Cecilia Lee 
 

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: Monday, 4 November 2024 2:33 pm 
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To: Cecilia Lee (CTPIS) <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: CTI REF: SNM24D206157/SLV4773T/C02/LEEPG - LKK REF: CD/CTI24110020/Uua3, SLS58S | DOA: 30/10/2024 - TPP 
DIRECT SETTLEMENT 
 

[Internal] 

 
Dear Cecilia,  
  
Please refer to the above subject. 
  
Kindly assist LKK Auto on D.S. soonest possible. 
  
Please contact our claims department Cecilia Lee | DID: 6389 6530 the officer in charge or 6389 6116 
should you require our assistance or clarification. 
  
*Kindly quote our claim reference number when replying. 
 
Thank you.  
 
Belinder Ng 
 
Claims Department 
  
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909   
DID: (65) 63896116   |   F: (65) 62247175   |   F: (65) 6222 1033 
   
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 4 November 2024 10:00 am 
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Meng Yan (LKK Auto) <mengyan@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLV4773T (OI : CTI - TBA) AND SLS58S (TP : LKK REF - CD/CTI24110020/Uua3) 
on 30/10/2024 
 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have inspected TP vehicle SLS 58S at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit on a WP basis and TP 
repairer proposed for a direct settlement. 
 
Enclosed for your perusal is:  

 CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you 
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.  
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- TP GIA report 
 
Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet. 
 
We will get back to you on preliminary advice. 
 
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 
 
Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Yan. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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