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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 January 2025 2:40 PM

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: SMA3593B SMRT GIA & Estimate - XIN YUN AUTO

Hi Huey Yon, thanks for your help. Please proceed to close SMA3593B. 

Sorry for the late reply, as recently repair works are over-flowed. We all stay very late. 

 

Thanks again, 

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

 

 

On Mon, Jan 20, 2025 at 3:42 PM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

Dear Yi Xin, 

Any updates? 

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 15 January 2025 9:09 AM 

To: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: FW: SMA3593B SMRT GIA & Estimate - XIN YUN AUTO 
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Dear Yi Xin, 

 Without prejudice 

 We will be re-advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $3,250.00 with 5 days of repair, subject to 

their approval. 

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 3 January 2025 9:12 AM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FW: SMA3593B SMRT GIA & Estimate - XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Hi Huey Yon, can we close at $3300 5days, thank you. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Mon, Dec 30, 2024 at 10:47 AM Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

Any updates? 
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Cheers to a Wonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful Christmas    and a    Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025 !   

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 

  

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 27 December 2024 8:17 AM 

To: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FW: SMA3593B SMRT GIA & Estimate - XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Dear Yi Xin, 

  

Without prejudice 

  

We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of LS $3,200.00 with 5 days of repair, subject to 

their approval. 

  

Cheers to a Wonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful ChristmasWonderful Christmas    and a    Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025Happy New Year 2025 !   

  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
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From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Monday, 18 November 2024 5:40 PM 

To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FW: SMA3593B SMRT GIA & Estimate - XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Hi Huey Yon, 

  

Good afternoon, pls refer to the attached final pictures for SMA3593B. Thanks. 

  

Looking forward to hearing from you soon. 

  

Best Regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 

  

  

On Wed, Oct 30, 2024 at 1:33 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Huey Yon,  

FYI--CS/SMR24100483/Anp3 

  

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 
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Own Damage & Third Party Property Damage 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@lkkauto.com fax:6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Xin Yun Auto Main <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 30 October 2024 1:23 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Adrian Ling (LKKAuto) <adrianling@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: SMA3593B SMRT GIA & Estimate - XIN YUN AUTO 

  

Dear Veron and Adrian, 

  

Good afternoon, please refer to the attached GIA report and Adrian's marking. Thanks. 

  

Thank you and best regards 

Yi Xin 

Xin Yun Auto Pte Ltd 

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-23, 

Premier@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 415875 

T: 9839-1555  | E: xinyunauto1@gmail.com 


