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Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 6 June 2025 2:40 PM
To: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030086 /YP6566P     Accident involving SMV9983J 

(our client) & YP6566P (Lonpac Ins's  Insured)  on 24/10/2024 *** LKK REF: 
CD/LPC24100414/Ama3

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Dear Daphne, 
 
Mandate as follows:  
 

Cost of repair  $16,250.00 

LOU  $1,308.00 
 
LTA/GIA/Report   
 

$2.18 

Total  
 

$17,560.18 

 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Charmaine Kong 
Claims Officer  | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/06 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.268 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2024 10:22 AM 
To: CHARMAINE KONG <charmainekong@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030086 /YP6566P Pre-repair Survey ~ Accident involving SMV9983J (our 
client) & YP6566P (Lonpac Ins's Insured) on 24/10/2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24100414/Ama3 
 
Dear Charmaine, 
 
Refer to the above matter 
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