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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 2 April 2025 5:12 PM
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC06/030080         REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 6689M & 

YN 3143G DOA ON 22.10.2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24100392/Xma3
Attachments: Re: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC06/030080/ YN3143G & XE6689M & YN 3143G DOA ON 

22.10.2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24100392/Xma3; Re: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC06/030080/ 
YN3143G & XE6689M & YN 3143G DOA ON 22.10.2024 *** LKK REF: 
CD/LPC24100392/Xma3

Categories: HMK

Hi Eric, 
 
Please refer to the attached email. 
 
Please note that no survey done. 
 
We will close the file without billing. 
 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT  
Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2024 2:17 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
Cc: MT_Claim_SG ; Admin A ; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)  
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC06/030080 REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 6689M & YN 3143G DOA ON 22.10.2024 
*** LKK REF: CD/LPC24100392/Xma3 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
Attached OI GIA for your reference. 
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Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT  
Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2024 4:26 pm 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
Cc: MT_Claim_SG ; Admin A ; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)  
Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC06/030080 REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 6689M & YN 3143G DOA ON 22.10.2024 *** 
LKK REF: CD/LPC24100392/Xma3  
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
Our insured have yet to report accident. 
 
Insured’s driver unfortunately passed on during the accident. 
 
We have contacted insured to send a representative to do accident report. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

-----Original Message----- 
From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
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Sent: Monday, 4 November 2024 11:23 am 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT  
Cc: MT_Claim_SG ; Admin A ; Daphne Lee (LKK Auto)  
Subject: RE: OUR REF: TBA/ YN3143G REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 6689M & YN 3143G DOA ON 
22.10.2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24100392/Xma3 
 
Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
We refer to the above matter. 
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident 
report for our necessary action. 
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Mei Kwan | Admin 
Third Party Direct Settlement 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 
1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, 
fraud or corrupt practices. 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2024 2:56 PM 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT ; Admin A ; assignments 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: OUR REF: TBA/ YN3143G REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 6689M & YN 3143G DOA 
ON 22.10.2024 
 
Dear Eric, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Hueh Yin | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi 
Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT 
Sent: Wednesday, October 23, 2024 2:34 PM 
To: Rajes (LKK Auto) ; Admin A ; assignments 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
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Subject: FW: OUR REF: TBA/ YN3143G REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 6689M & YN 3143G 
DOA ON 22.10.2024 
 
Lonpac External - General 
 
Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear LKK, 
 
Below PRI email FYNA. 
 
OI yet to report accident. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, 
fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, 
fraud or corrupt practices. 
-----Original Message----- 
From: info@speedwerkz.biz <info@speedwerkz.biz> 
Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2024 2:27 pm 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: Re: OUR REF: TBA/ YN3143G REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 6689M & YN 3143G DOA 
ON 22.10.2024 
 
Dear Officer 
 
We would like to have LKK for the inspection 
 
Hear from you soon 
 
Best regards 
Julie 
 
 
-------- Original Message -------- 
Subject: OUR REF: TBA/ YN3143G           REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 
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6689M & YN 3143G DOA ON 22.10.2024 
Date: 2024-10-23 14:22 
 From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com> 
To: "info@speedwerkz.biz" <info@speedwerkz.biz> 
 
Lonpac External - General 
 
Lonpac External - General 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sir, 
 
We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle and enclose the names of our 
Motor surveyor firms for your attention:- 
 
1. FormTeam Adjusters Pte Ltd 
2. LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, 
fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, 
fraud or corrupt practices. 
-----Original Message----- 
 From: info@speedwerkz.biz <info@speedwerkz.biz> 
Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2024 11:06 am 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: REQUEST ARRANGE PRI FOR XE 6689M & YOUR REF: YN 3143G DOA ON 
22.10.2024 
 
Dear Sir/Madam 
 
"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" 
 
Kindly arrange surveyor to inspect our client vehicle at 
 
SpeedWerkz Pte Ltd 
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 
#01-73 Autobay@Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
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Person in Charge - Jason - 81890858 
 
WE WOULD LIKE TO HAVE THE SURVEYOR LIST FOR THE INSPECTION 
 
Hear from you soon. 
 
Regards, 
 
Julie (Claim Department) 
SpeedWerkz Pte Ltd 
ROC: 202127390C 
Add: 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 
#01-73 Autobay@Kaki Bukit 
Singapore 417883 
DID: 90996204 


