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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2024 6:38 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Cc: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto); Admin A
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030045            LIABILITY CHECK FOR ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING SKJ5299P & GBK4324H ON 17/10/2024 *** LKK REF: 
CD/LPC24100348/Xma3

Attachments: OI GIA - GBK4324H.PDF

Categories: HMK

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Mei Kwan, 
 
Please refer to attached. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2024 5:38 pm 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Daphne Lee (LKK Auto) <daphnelee@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030045 LIABILITY CHECK FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ5299P & GBK4324H ON 
17/10/2024 *** LKK REF: CD/LPC24100348/Xma3  
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Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

Third Party Direct Settlement 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Hueh Yin (LKK Auto) <huehyin@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2024 11:09 AM 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments 
<assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030045 LIABILITY CHECK FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ5299P & GBK4324H ON 
17/10/2024 
 
Dear Eric, 
 
Thank you for the assignment. 
 
Please be informed that vehicle not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Hueh Yin | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ERICWOO@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, October 21, 2024 10:45 AM 
To: Rajes (LKK Auto) <rajes@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments 
<assignments@lkkauto.com> 
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Subject: OUR REF: 24/24/24/VC05/030045 LIABILITY CHECK FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ5299P & GBK4324H ON 
17/10/2024 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Rajes, 
 
Below PRI email FYNA. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
 
Eric Woo 
Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
DID: 6279 9240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
 
 
 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: WAH HONG MOTORS & CREDIT <MOTOR@WAHHONG.SG>  
Sent: Monday, 21 October 2024 10:27 am 
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: OUR REF: UC1402 LIABILITY CHECK FOR ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ5299P & GBK4324H ON 17/10/2024  
 

Dear Sir,  

We refer to the above matter. 

We are assisting C A S MARINE PTE LTD the owner of SKJ5299P, pursuing a third party motor 
claim again GBK4324H. 

Kindly update us that have your insured GBK4324H file a report on the mention accident? If yes, 
please let us know your confirmation on liability for the above accident. 
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Please be informed that our client has yet to leave their vehicle to our premises for claim, however 
we have our client's instructions to check liability for the above matter. 

Kindly let us have your reply, we have attached the GIA for your kind perusal. 

--  
regards, 
 
Jean Josephine 
Wah Hong Motors & Credit Pte Ltd 
ROC:199806235M 
42 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST 
#01-79 ENTERPRISE HUB 
SINGAPORE 608583 
Website: www.wahhong.sg 
Email: motor@wahhong.sg 
 
TEL:     6773 7377 
DID:     8778 2252 
 
This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients 
and may contain confidential and / or privileged information. If you are not the intended 
recipient, please do not read, copy, use or disclose the contents of this communication 
to others and notify the sender immediately. Then please delete the e-mail and any copies 
of it.Thank you. 

 

We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 


