Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, June 13, 2025 2:45 PM

To: Jason Tea Chee Kiat

Cc: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto); Joanne Tan Jo Ann; Yan (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Payment On Hold || D24009020MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2: TP Direct Settlement - Accident
Involving SH 7318X (Ol) and SJR 3677P (TP) on 11/10/2024

Attachments: LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf; TP DS SUPPORTING DOCUMENT_REVISED.pdf

Dear Jason,

We attached here with a copy of revise documents for your necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Team Lead

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, June 13, 2025 10:59 AM

To: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <joannelee@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Joanne Tan Jo
Ann <joannetan@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: Payment On Hold | | D24009020MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SH 7318X (Ol) and
SJR 3677P (TP) on 11/10/2024

Dear Yan,
Payment cannot process as TAX Invoice is issue to us.

Please get the amended copy from the workshop so that we can process payment



AE (M R) ASABK »F
LAl HUAT (MENG KEE) MOTOR PTE LTD

164 Sin Ming Dirive #04-01, #04-02 & #0703 Singapore 575722 Tel: 6453 8110 Fax: 6450 6267
GST No: M2-0123609-2

UEN: 193407592C

TAX INVOICE

ESTNo ... .: - ESTO035860 GSTRegNo .............: M2-0128

Chang Yong Chin Lawrence Page “aomessissaarsel of
Number . ....... g : INV0Q38
Your el coecsssaeaane - TP-SH 7.
JobNo. ... . . 74765
5 24 10.15
Payment .................:

Attn ..........C |5,- 10~ 8!11.‘202

Vehicle No ... SJR 3877P
Vehicle Madel ; Toyota Altis
Accident on .. 11/106/2024

Quantity Unit Description ' Unit price Disc. pct. A
1.00 To supply and replace paris; labour charges 1,200.00 5
for repairing, knocking, we!dlng and to '
respray paint

Best Regards
Jason Tea
Motor Claims Dept

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

16 Raffles Quay #42-01 Hong Leong Building| Singapore 048581

D: 6359 1822 Tel: 6359 1800 | F: 6223 0541 | Reg. No. 195000106C
Website http://www,msfirstcapital.com.sg

AHember of EINRTENRE INSURANCE GROLP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 (""PDPA"):
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to http.//www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA
Personal Data Collection Statement.




Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward,
disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately
by return e-mail.

From: Joanne Lee (LKK Auto) <joannelee @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 June 2025 12:00 pm

To: Jason Tea Chee Kiat <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: Yan (LKK Auto) <yan@Ikkauto.com>; Motor Claims <MotorClaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: D24009020MFCT/CTPL/TPD 2: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SH 7318X (Ol) and SJR 3677P (TP) on
11/10/2024

EXTERNAL EMAIL - This email was sent by a person from outside your organization. Exercise caution when clicking links, opening
attachments or taking further action, before validating its authenticity.

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that the above-mentioned case had been settled.

Enclose herewith final report & relevant documents for your necessary action please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JOANNE | Reports
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@I|kkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933






