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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 27 June 2025 2:38 PM
To: Loi Ai Ting
Cc: Kevin Leong Wai Kit; Lim Yan Shi Jenn; Coco Lu Ting; SUR
Subject: RE: SLE1771H - Finalization-CIT-wip : 10494

Dear Ai Ting, 
 
Kindly send your LOD with Repair sum $14,000.00 with 7 repair days to insurance company. 
 

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
 

From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 27 June 2025 2:10 PM 
To: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lim Yan Shi Jenn <jenn.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; SUR 
<sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLE1771H - Finalization-CIT-wip : 10494 
 
Dear Huey Yon, 
 
We received and noted on your finalized confirmation email dated 20.06.2025. 
 
Will sent LOD to you once ready. 
 
Kindly advise what need to be update? 
 
Thanks. 
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Best Regards, 
 
Loi Ai Ting 
 

 
 
Cycle & Carriage Singapore •  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
TEL: 6568 4501 DID: 6568 4556 •  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
 

 
 
From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, June 27, 2025 1:06 PM 
To: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Cc: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lim Yan Shi Jenn <jenn.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SLE1771H - Finalization-CIT-wip : 10494 
 

This email was sent from outside of your organisation  

Dear Ai Ting, 
 
Any updates? 
 

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 20 June 2025 10:57 AM 
To: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
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Cc: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lim Yan Shi Jenn <jenn.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: SLE1771H - Finalization-CIT-wip : 10494 
 
Dear Ai Ting, 
   
“Without Prejudice”  
    
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair of repair sum $14,000.00 /- with 7 days of repair, subject to their approval.  

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, June 19, 2025 8:03 AM 
To: Marcus Chua (LKKAuto) <MarcusChua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: SLE1771H - Finalization-CIT-wip : 10494 
 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 16 June 2025 11:46 AM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: FW: SLE1771H - Finalization-CIT-wip : 10494 
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From: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 16 June 2025 11:36:10 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lim Yan Shi Jenn <jenn.lim@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Taufikh 
(LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SLE1771H - Finalization-CIT-wip : 10494 

Dear All, 
  
Can we confirm finalised amount at $ 17,906.52 after GST 
  
Do let us know if there are any issues. 
  
Appreciate. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
  
Loi Ai Ting 
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore ∙  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
TEL: 6568 4501 DID: 6568 4556 ∙  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
  

 
  
From: Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, May 26, 2025 1:06 PM 
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg> 
Subject: SLE1771H - Finalization-CIT-wip : 10494 
  
Dear All, 
  
Can we confirm finalised amount at $ 17,906.52 after GST 
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Thank You & Best regards  
  
Kevin Leong 
Claim Division Operations 
209 Pandan Gardens 
Singapore 609339 
  

 
  
Cycle & Carriage Singapore ∙  209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 
T: +65 6568 4501 ∙  F: +65 6565 1240 ∙ H: +65 81680997 ∙  www.cyclecarriage.com.sg 
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain 
information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any 
attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any 
views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.  
DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may 
contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this 
email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the 
original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or 
any of its related corporations.  


